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Roebuck student earns place 

on Furman University's Dean's List

Greenville - Jacob Henjes of Roebuck has earned a place
on Furman University's dean's list for the 2020 spring
semester. Furman's dean's list is composed of full-time
undergraduate students who earn a grade point average of
3.4 or higher on a four-point system. Henjes' parents are
Shana Henjes and Doug Henjes.

Furman is a private, undergraduate liberal arts and sci-
ences university of 2,800 students in Greenville, South
Carolina. The university is noted for its rigorous academic
program and strong faculty, and its 750-acre campus is
widely recognized as one of the most beautiful in the nation.

Three Spartanburg County students complete

Accelerate, GSSM’s virtual engineering program

Hartsville ─ Brandon Anthony Carter, Thomas Garrett
Pemberton, and Andrew Watson of Spartanburg County
received their certificates of completion for Accelerate, the
South Carolina Governor’s School for Science &
Mathematics (GSSM) virtual engineering program, on
Wednesday, June 3, 2020.

Brandon Anthony Carter of James F. Byrnes High School
will attend Clemson University.

Thomas Garrett Pemberton of James F. Byrnes High
School will attend Clemson University.

Andrew Watson of James F. Byrnes High School will
attend Clemson University.

The award and recognition ceremony was designed to cel-
ebrate their achievements and successful completion of this
one-of-a-kind, three-year engineering program.

Originally launched with private support, Accelerate is
currently funded through the South Carolina General
Assembly and corporate partnerships. The program empha-
sizes mastery of the foundational tools of engineering, such
as physics, calculus, and chemistry, but also places signifi-
cant emphasis on real-world, team-based projects, creativity,
and communication.

In total, 23 students from around the state received their
certificates, representing eleven South Carolina high
schools.

Spartans women’s golf tandem of Paksanont/Hutto

finish runner-up at 

43rd Carolinas Women’s Four-Ball Championship

Newton, N.C. – The USC Upstate women’s golf tandem
of Pan Paksanont (Nonthaburi, Thailand) and Brooke Hutto
(Aiken, Class of 2019) finished in a tie for second place (-
10) at the 43rd Carolinas Women’s Four-Ball Championship
recently.

An opening round 66 placed the duo in a tie for second
yesterday afternoon. Paksanont had the highlight of the day,
picking up a birdie on hole four and following it up with an
Eagle on the fifth hole. The pair got off to a slow start shoot-
ing even on the front nine. Hutto then carded four consecu-
tive birdies on the back nine to catapult the tandem back into
a tie for second place.

Hutto capped her senior season at USC Upstate (2019) by
appearing in 11 events and playing in 28 total rounds. Hutto
had a 77.75 stroke average, putting her third on the team.
Her lowest round came in the BUBBA Burger Jacksonville
Classic on October 1st and 2nd where she shot a team low
72.

This past season, Paksanont led the team and had the sec-
ond best winning percentage in school history at .876. The
senior’s 73.83 stroke average is tied for the second lowest in
program history and she capped her season with a low round
of 70. The Thailand native recorded a trio of top-10 finishes
and a pair of top-five finishes this season.

The pairing of Emma Charles (Hartsville) and Victoria
Hall (Moore) shot up the leader board as they shot a six-
under par round to tie with Hutto/Paksanont. The duo of
Jensen Castle (West Columbia) and Rachel Kuehn
(Asheville, N.C.) won the event with back-to-back rounds of
64 for a final score of 128 (-16).

United Community Banks, Inc. completes acquisition  

of Three Shores Bancorporation, Inc. 

and its wholly owned bank subsidiary, 

Seaside National Bank & Trust

Greenville – United Community Banks, Inc. (NASDAQ:
UCBI) (“United”) has completed its merger, effective July 1,
with Three Shores Bancorporation, Inc. (OTCPK: TSHR)
(“Three Shores”).

Also, effective July 1, Three Shores’ bank subsidiary,
Seaside National Bank & Trust, merged into United’s bank
subsidiary, United Community Bank. However, United
Community Bank intends to continue to operate the Seaside
locations using the Seaside Bank and Trust brand following
conversion to United’s operating systems, which is expected
in February 2021.

Dear Readers: I'll be taking

a break from writing my col-

umn to focus on helping those

in need during the coronavirus

crisis. Meantime, I'd like to

share with you some of my

favorite summertime recipes

from years past. Hopefully,

they'll inspire you to cook up

something "Diva-Licious."

Calypso is probably best

known as a type of Caribbean

folk song. It's inspired by a

combination of musical styles

and languages common to

Trinidad. Calypso music is

rhythmically smooth, and the

words are often colorful and

sharply critical in a witty way.

This recipe for Calypso

Black Bean and Corn Salad

draws inspiration from the

Caribbean, the easy spirit of

the islands and the music

heard there. The salad takes

only a few minutes to assem-

ble, and it can be served either

cold or at room temperature.

Best of all, most of the ingre-

dients can be found in the

pantry or the freezer.

This festive salad instantly

became one of my all-time

favorites when I was chal-

lenged by chef Bobby Flay on

his Food Network show

"Throwdown With Bobby

Flay." I decided to serve the

Calypso Black Bean and

Corn Salad as a side dish with

my fiery Jerk Chicken.

The wonderful thing about

this combination of black

beans, corn and spices is that it

perfectly complements the

smokiness of barbequed

meats. It's unique and colorful,

and it tastes better the longer it

sits in the pepper-infused cit-

rus marinade. The judges

loved my dishes, and I was

declared the winner of the

challenge. 

While it was wonderful to

claim a culinary victory over

chef Flay, the real winners

were the guests at the bar-

beque. They got to eat some of

the best dishes in Texas! Try

this delicious salad, and you'll

feel like a winner, too!

CALYPSO CORN AND

BLACK BEAN SALAD

1 (10-ounce) package

frozen corn kernels, thawed

2 (15-ounce) cans black

beans, drained and rinsed

1 large red bell pepper, seed-

ed and diced

1 small fresh jalape–o chili,

seeded and minced

1/2 cup firmly packed

chopped fresh cilantro

1/4 cup freshly squeezed

lime juice

2 tablespoons vegetable oil

1 teaspoon sugar

1 teaspoon salt

1 teaspoon freshly ground

black pepper

Combine the corn, beans,

bell pepper, jalapeno, cilantro,

lime juice, oil, sugar, salt and

pepper in a large bowl. Taste

and adjust seasonings. Cover

and chill one hour or

overnight to combine flavors.

Serves 4 to 6.  ***

Angela Shelf Medearis is an

award-winning children's

author, culinary historian and

the author of seven cook-

books. (c) 2020 King Features

Synd., Inc., and Angela Shelf

Medearis

CHANGE SERVICE REQUESTED

A cool salad 

for hot days
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$605,000 in grants awarded for health initiatives

The Spartanburg Reg-

ional Foundation grants

program infused more

than $600,000 this year

into Spartanburg Regional

Healthcare System and

local non-profit organiza-

tions committed to pro-

moting health and well-

ness. Grants for communi-

ty organizations are

focused on meeting the

ongoing challenges

brought on by COVID-19,

while health system grants

will support a wide range

of innovative programs to

promote access to care for

those in need.

“The Foundation is

proud to support a deserv-

ing group of 2020 recipi-

ents, and we are grateful to

the donors who make these

grants possible,” said

Kristy Caradori, executive

director of the Foundation.

“This is a difficult time for

many in our community,

and our Grants and

Allocations Committee

and Board of Trustees

were committed to bol-

stering partner organiza-

tions that continue to serve

vulnerable populations

during the COVID-19

pandemic. We are also

excited about health sys-

tem initiatives that will

address critical areas, from

mental health and opioid

abuse prevention to much-

needed access to oral

health care, and more.”

The following nonprofit

organizations are each

receiving a grant of

$13,445 to support essen-

tial safety net services for

Upstate residents in need

during the COVID-19

pandemic.

* Cherokee County

Meals on Wheels

* Free Medical Clinic of

Cherokee County

* Greer Relief and

Resources Agency

* Hope Center for Child-

ren

* Middle Tyger Commu-

nity Center

* Mobile Meal Service

of Spartanburg County,

Inc.

* SAFE Homes – Rape

Crisis Coalition

* St. Luke's Free

Medical Clinic

* TOTAL Ministries

The following Spartan-

burg Regional Healthcare

System departments and

programs are receiving

grant support in 2020:

* AccessHealth Spartan-

burg, $38,256

This grant will support

dental care for clients.

* Medical Group of the

Carolinas – Orthopaedics

– Skylyn, $20,000

This grant will fund pill

disposal to help reduce the

dependency of opioid

addiction.

Medical Group of the

Carolinas – Psychiatry,

$28,750

This grant will increase

access to behavioral

health.

Spartanburg Medical

Center – Organ, Tissue,

Eye Donor Program,

$4,150

This grant will assist

with data collection on

organ donation.

Spartanburg Regional

Healthcare System –

Administration, $285,000 

This grant will support

access to oral health care

for area residents.

Spartanburg Regional

Healthcare System –

Trauma, $2,844

This grant will fund

bleeding control kits and

educational materials. 

Union Medical Center,

$30,000

This grant will provide

medications to patients

residing in Union County.

Woodruff Manor,

$75,000

This grant will provide

funds for an outdoor court-

yard at the facility.
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OneSpartanburg awards $10K

to SAM ‘Smart Start’ program 
"Our analysis has shown

that over 19% of our stu-

dents across Spartanburg

County that have said

they're going to college are

not actually enrolling. We

need to change that," said

Meghan Smith, Director of

College and Career Readi-

ness for the Spartanburg

Academic Movement.

To remedy that, the

Spartanburg Academic

Movement is introducing

Smart Start, a program

designed to help students

bridge the gap between

their intention to start col-

lege and their actual

enrollment. OneSpartan-

burg recently contributed

$10,000 to pilot the pro-

gram, furthering their part-

nership with SAM to

develop homegrown talent

from cradle to career.

The Smart Start program

is beginning this week by

connecting 23 community

members who have volun-

teered to serve as mentors

with more than 100 gradu-

ated Spartanburg High

School seniors who have

been invited to participate

in the program. Mentors

and students will commu-

nicate through secure text

lines. Students who com-

plete the program and

enroll in college will earn

$250 in credits to their col-

lege’s bookstore to offset

expenses for books, sup-

plies or technology.

"We at Spartanburg High

School are so appreciative

of this opportunity for our

recent graduates. Our most

sincere thanks to One-

Spartanburg for the gener-

ous donation and Spartan-

burg Academic Movement

for the partnership to help

ensure these targeted stu-

dents follow through with

all the steps to enroll in

college," said Piper

Holmes, Assistant Director

of Guidance at Spartan-

burg High School.

John Stockwell, Executive Director of the Spartanburg Academic

Movement and Meghan Smith, Director of College and Career Readiness

for the Spartanburg Academic Movement, display the $10K check

received from OneSpartanburg.
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Around the Upstate
Global bottler Refresco expanding for second 

time in 2020 in Greenville County
Greenville - The Green-

ville Area Development

Corporation (GADC),

charged with promoting

and enhancing quality of

life in Greenville County

by facilitating job growth

and investment, recently

announced that Refresco, a

global independent bottler

for both retailers and A-

brands in Europe and

North America, plans to

expand operations for the

second time in 2020 in

Greenville County. The

company’s multi-million-

dollar investment is pro-

jected to create 40 new

jobs.

Founded in 1999 and

among the world’s largest

independent bottlers of

beverages, Refresco has

over 60 manufacturing

sites across Europe and

North America.  Refresco

provides a variety of serv-

ices from developing new

flavors to providing pack-

aging, storage and distri-

bution.

“The entire team at

Refresco in Greer has

worked hard to earn this

opportunity to grow the

business. I couldn’t be

prouder of the employees I

have the privilege to lead

and represent,” said

Refresco Greer Plant

Manager William Wise.

“They have demonstrated

consistency in manufactur-

ing excellence, and as a

result, have attracted new

business and new cus-

tomers. We are excited to

take this next step and to

build on our success!”

Located at 1990 Hood

Road in Greer, Refresco’s

latest  expansion will

ensure that the Greer oper-

ation has the manufactur-

ing, packaging, processing

and quality testing scale

and flexibility needed by

customers as demand con-

tinues to grow.  Globally,

Refresco is focused on

providing total beverage

solutions to customers

with innovative products,

added-value service and

use of sustainable materi-

als. Additional packaging,

processing and quality

testing equipment will be

procured as part of this

expansion. 

“South Carolina’s busi-

ness-friendly climate is

recognized all over the

world, and that reputation

strengthens when compa-

nies like Refresco expand

within our borders. This is

the company’s second

expansion in less than a

year, and we look forward

to their continued success

for years to come,” com-

mented South Carolina

Governor Henry

McMaster.

“Today’s announcement

is fantastic news, as this is

Refresco’s second expan-

sion in Greenville County

this year,” added South

Carolina Secretary of

Commerce Bobby Hitt.

“We’re proud to celebrate

Refresco’s continued suc-

cess and growth in our

state. They are making a

statement that South

Carolina – with our pro-

business climate and high-

ly skilled workforce – is

‘Just right’ for business.”

The project is expected

to be completed by late

December 2020. Individ-

uals interested in joining

the Refresco team should

visit https://www.refres-

co.com/en/careers/endless-

opportunities.

"Refresco extends the

lineage of one of Green-

ville County's most vener-

able companies. Among

the world’s largest inde-

pendent beverage bottlers

for retail brands, Refresco

packages everything from

fruit juices to sports

drinks,” stated Greenville

County Council Chairman

and Greenville Area

Development Corporation

Board Member H.G.

"Butch" Kirven.  “We con-

gratulate Refresco on this

expansion, and appreciate

its commitment to cus-

tomers, employees and

communities in Greenville

County."

The Coordinating Coun-

cil for Economic Develop-

ment has approved a

$100,000 Set-Aside grant

to Greenville County to

assist with costs related to

this project.

“Refresco is an excellent

corporate citizen and val-

ued member of the Greer

community, and widely

known for delivering qual-

ity and cost advantages to

beverage customers

around the world. We con-

gratulate them on their

continuing success and

expansion and are proud to

have Refresco call the city

of Greer home,” comment-

ed City of Greer Mayor

Rick Danner.

Refresco is expanding for the second time in 2020 in Greenville County.

Greenville - The Green-

ville Area Development

Corporation has named

Kornelia Kostka as the

economic development

organization’s new

Research Manager.

In her new role, Ms.

Kostka will manage the

GADC’s research efforts

that include maintaining

key information on the

agency’s website, manag-

ing its sites and buildings

database, and responding

to a variety of complex

information requests.  She

will also prepare data

reports, develop cus-

tomized maps, and com-

pile targeted workforce

information in support of

business recruitment and

retention. 

A native of Kielce,

Poland, Ms. Kostka earned

her Bachelor of Science

degree in Finance and

Accounting from the

College of Charleston,

where she also excelled as

a member of the universi-

ty’s cross country and

track and field teams.

Following graduation, Ms.

Kostka worked as a data

analyst for Lending Tree

subsidiary SnapCap in

Charleston before return-

ing to Krakow, Poland to

work in banking opera-

tions with Euroclear Bank.

Ms. Kostka returned to

the United States to attend

the University of South

Carolina’s Moore School

of Business where she

earned her International

MBA in 2020, while also

working in supply chain

management during

Summer 2019 with United

Parcel Service. 

Her additional prior

work experience includes

time in accounting and

logistics with Allen Lund

Company, and working in

business development sup-

port for the South Carolina

Department of

Commerce’s Munich,

Germany office.  A skilled

researcher with fluency in

Polish and English, as well

as growing proficiency in

French, Ms. Kostka also is

a former member of the

Polish National Track and

Field Team.

“Kornelia’s strong ana-

lytical capabilities

impressed our team.  Add

to this her diverse business

background, multilingual

skills and international

perspective, and I have no

doubt that she will be a

valuable addition to the

GADC team,” said Kevin

Landmesser, GADC’s

Senior Vice President.

“We are pleased to wel-

come her as our new

Research Manager and

look forward to fully uti-

lizing her unique experi-

ence in research, finance,

analytics, and problem

solving.”

Kostka named Greenville Area Development

Corporation Research Manager
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Top ways to take a safe vacation this summer
(StatePoint) After

months spent indoors at

home due to the coron-

avirus pandemic, it’s clear

that many people are itch-

ing to get back out there

and take a vacation. This is

with good reason. Staying

isolated for too long can

take a substantial toll on

one’s mental health and

well-being, according to

the American Psychologi-

cal Association.

If you still feel uncom-

fortable with going far

from your home for a trav-

el experience however,

traveling domestically can

be a step in the right direc-

tion. There are lots of great

places to visit a few hours’

drive from your home that

you probably didn’t think

of! Whether you’re look-

ing for a beach stay, or

some nature, exploring

options close to home can

allow for an escape you

and your family want, and

in a safe environment,

such as an apartment or

home vacation rental. And

it’s an increasingly popular

choice. According to triva-

go, a global accommoda-

tion metasearch provider,

the share of users clicking

on deals for such vacation

rentals increased by 5 per-

cent from February to June

2020, both in the U.S. and

internationally.

As you book and plan

your travel, here are a few

tips to consider to help

ensure you have a healthy

and safe experience:

• DIY Cleaning: If you

are worried about cleaning

standards, consider seek-

ing out accommodations

where you don’t have to

worry about someone else

coming into your space

during your stay. Bring

your own wipes, anti-bac-

terial soap and other sup-

plies and wipe down sur-

faces when you arrive, and

as often as needed. Of

course, you should always

check with your accommo-

dation provider about their

hygiene standards to make

sure they meet your expec-

tations. Major hotel chains

have announced special

cleaning protocols in light

of the coronavirus.

• Beating the Crowds:

From beach houses to

mountain cabins, try to

look for a vacation experi-

ence away from densely

populated city destina-

tions, which is a good

choice for those wanting to

beat the crowds.

• Staying Active: Getting

away doesn’t have to mean

staying indoors some-

where new. Take a leisure-

ly stroll on a beach. Go on

a hike in the mountains.

Explore a national park

you’ve always wanted to

see. Brunch at a small

local café. There are plenty

of ways to stay active and

have fun, all while follow-

ing social distance guide-

lines.

• Choosing Your Desti-

nation: So where is every-

body going? The current

most popular U.S travel

destinations by click share

according to trivago are:

1. Las Vegas

2. Myrtle Beach, S.C.

3. Panama City Beach,

Fla.

4. Virginia Beach, Va.

5. Destin, Fla.

6. Miami Beach, Fla.

7. Ocean City, Md.

8. Galveston, Texas

9. South Padre Island,

Texas

10. Orlando, Fla.

11. Key West, Fla.

For more travel tips and

ideas, visit trivago.com,

and trivago.com/corona

for the most up-to-date

travel restrictions.

Whether you hit up a

popular destination or head

somewhere remote, make

sure you adhere to local

health guidelines when

traveling. And above all,

stay safe and healthy.

PHOTO SOURCE: (c)

jacoblund / iStock via

Getty Images Plus

Charlotte, N.C. –This

summer, AAA forecasts

Americans will take 700

million trips based on eco-

nomic indicators and state

re-openings. That number

is down nearly 15% com-

pared to last July through

September and is the first

decline in summer travel

since 2009. 

“Though cautiously and

more spontaneous, AAA

booking trends show that

Americans are in fact still

making travel plans for

this summer,” said Tiffany

Wright, AAA spokesper-

son – The Auto Club

Group in the Carolinas.

“When they do start to get

out and explore, travelers

will hit the roads to take on

683 million road trips.”

Car trips reign supreme

accounting for 97% of the

favored mode of trans-

portation. Air travel will be

off by about 74%, while

rail, cruise ship and bus

travel will slide by 86%.

Were it not for the pan-

demic, AAA would be pro-

jecting 857 million trips

during the third quarter, a

3.6% increase over last

year. By this analysis, the

pandemic wiped out nearly

150 million person-trips

this summer.

AAA travel experts have

begun to see positive

trends in travel, noting that

hotel and rental car book-

ings have been gradually

increasing since April. Air

travel has been slower to

rebound. The share of trav-

elers making plans 48

hours to 7 days before

departure – a sign that peo-

ple are arranging last-

minute trips – is signifi-

cantly higher than normal.

Road Trips and Top

TripkTik Destinations

With travel restrictions

lifting but social distanc-

ing still recommended, it’s

no surprise that 97% of

summer trips are road

trips. That’s up from an

average of 87% over the

last five years. Road trips

allow travelers to make

their own schedule and

customize stops based on

comfort level and interests.

For families, especially

those with small children,

it is an easy and less

expensive way to travel.

And an added benefit right

now - gas prices remain

low.

This summer, road trip-

pers should plan their trav-

el in advance using AAA

TripTik – a tradition that

has guided generations of

road trippers with paper

and digital maps. Plus, it

now includes COVID-19

Travel Restriction updates.

When it comes to

TripTik destination search-

es, prominent cities that

typically draw large

crowds are not as popular.

Orlando, Florida has

dropped from the top

searched city destination

to number eight while

Denver, Colorado makes

the biggest climb from

number 10 to number one:

(Data based on

TripTik.AAA.com search-

es from March 15 – June

14, 2020)

1. Denver, CO

2. Las Vegas, NV

3. Los Angeles, CA

4. Seattle, WA

5. Phoenix, AZ

6. Portland, OR

7. Myrtle Beach, SC

8. Orlando, FL

9. San Diego, CA

10. Nashville, TN

According to AAA

Travel in the Carolinas,

here are the top 5 most

popular Cruise and Tour

destinations booked for

summer 2020 travel:

1. Florida

2. Italy

3. Ireland

4. Wyoming

5. Germany

And here are the top 5

most popular Driving

Routes requested:

1. Myrtle Beach, South

Carolina

2. Denver, Colorado

3. Dallas, Texas

4. Asheville, North Caro-

lina

5. Williamsburg, Virgin-

ia

For travelers looking to

plan their Great American

Road Trip, AAA recom-

mends visiting https:/

/www.aaa.com/roadtrips/.

Road Trips and Traffic

across the Country

INRIX, in collaboration

with AAA, analyzed the

top 20 metropolitan areas

and all states to inform

travelers of the chances

they will run into traffic

when they travel. While

the top 20 metro areas will

remain below typical traf-

fic congestion, a number

of states could expect to

see traffic congestion rise

to normal levels – but still

be below usual summer

traffic patterns.

According to INRIX, the

chances that North

Carolinians are likely to

run into “normal” traffic

congestion while traveling

is below 50% - whereas

South Carolinians are

more likely than not to run

into “normal” traffic con-

gestion while traveling.

Summer Gas Prices at

17-year Lows

Carolinians can expect to

find the lowest summer-

time gas prices since 2003.

Demand is still down near-

ly 25% compared to last

year and while North

Carolina’s state average is

just above $2 per gallon at

$2.04, South Carolina’s

state average is still lower

at $1.92 per gallon.

When at the pump, AAA

recommends wearing dis-

posable gloves or using a

plastic sandwich bag to

avoid touching the pump

handle. When back in your

car, be sure to clean your

hands with sanitizer or

wipes.

Hotel Sanitation Tips

Prior to your hotel stay,

AAA recommends calling

ahead to ensure your hotel

is still open and asking

about any restrictions or

changes to the check-in

process. It’s likely that the

hotel has reduced the num-

ber of times guests have

face-to-face interactions

with other guests and hotel

staff. When you check into

your room, remember to

wipe down surfaces with

disinfecting wipes. Pay

special attention to sur-

faces such as light switch-

es, door knobs, faucets and

remote controls.

Other Modes of Trans-

portation

Other modes of trans-

portation – cruises, buses

and rail – have seen the

most dramatic drop in trav-

el volume. Most cruise

lines have suspended all

departures until at least

August 1, with only limit-

ed offerings after that.

AAA, however, has noted

growing demand for

departures in 2021.

Rail travel offers a

unique way to see the

country, and AAA offers a

number of itineraries to

explore iconic cities as

well as the National Parks

and beyond at AAA.com/

vacations.

AAA forecasts Americans will take 700 million trips this summer

***** Please note

that all events

through July 31

have been can-

celled due to

COVID-19. Please

visit www.cityof

spartanburg.org

for more 

information. *****
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Legal Notices
LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE PROBATE COURT

IN THE MATTER OF: CHARLES
RONALD EVANS

Case Number: 2020ES4200703
Notice of Hearing

To: Any and All Unknown Mater-
nal Heirs of Charles Ronald
Evans
Date: Wednesday, August 26,

2020
Time: 10:00 a.m.
Place: Spartanburg County

Probate Court, 180 Magnolia
Street, Room 302, Spartanburg,
S.C. 29306
Purpose of Hearing: Applica-

tion for Informal Appointment
Executed this 28th day of

April, 2020.
RAYMOND E. EVANS
617 Fort Prince Boulevard
Wellford, South Carolina 29385
864-360-6617
864-395-3413
Relationship to Decedent/
Estate: Cousin
6-25, 7-2, 9

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE PROBATE COURT

Case Number 2020ES4200649
Jane Myers Collins, individu-
ally and as Trustee under
Declaration of Trust of Alpha
Kay Jordan, Petitioner, vs.
Judith Myers, Terry Jordan,
Steve Jordan, Pamela Jordan,
Elaine J. Lee, Caroline J.
Prater, Sara J. Gregory,
Leslie J. Blue, Albert Jordan,
Rosie J. Jensen and Charles
Jordan, Respondents. 
In Re: Estate of Alpha Kay
Jordan, deceased

Summons
TO the above named Respon-

dents in this action:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Supple-
mental Petition and Petition
in this action, which were
filed in the Spartanburg
County Probate Court on May
11, 2020, copies of which are
herewith served upon you, and
to serve a copy of your answer
to the said Supplemental Peti-
tion and Petition on the sub-
scribers at their office at
Spartanburg, SC, within thirty
(30) days after the service
hereof, exclusive of the day
of such service; and if you
fail to answer the Supplemen-
tal Petition and Petition
within the time aforesaid, the
Petitioner in this action will
apply to the Court for the
relief demanded in the Supple-
mental Petition and Petition.
May, 2020
JAMES B. DRENNAN, III
Dennis, Shaw, Drennan & Pack,
LLC
103 Lafayette Street
Spartanburg, SC 29302
Phone: (864)582-0708
Attorneys for Petitioner

STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE PROBATE COURT

IN THE MATTER OF: ESTATE OF
ALPHA KAY JORDAN (Decedent)
Case Number 2020ES4200649

Notice of Hearing
DATE: August 5, 2020
TIME: 3:00 p.m.
PLACE: Spartanburg County

Probate Court
PURPOSE OF HEARING: Hearing

on Petition for Formal Testacy
and Appointment and Supplemen-
tal Petition
Executed this 18th day of

June, 2020.
JAMES B. DRENNAN, III
Attorney for Petitioner
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, S.C. 29304
Phone: (864) 582-0708
E-mail: jdrennan@dsdlegal.com
Attorney for Petitioner
6-25, 7-2, 9

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
Case No.: 2020-CP-42-01351

Daniel Howlands, LLC, Plain-
tiff, vs. Andre Sutherland as
Sole Heir of Ronald Suther-
land, John Doe and Jane Doe,
Defendants.

Summons
TO THE DEFENDANTS ABOVE

NAMED:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the com-
plaint herein, a copy of which
is herewith served upon you,
and to serve a copy of your
answer to this complaint upon
the subscriber, at the address
shown below, within thirty
(30) days after service here-
of, exclusive of the day of
such service, and if you fail
to answer the complaint, judg-
ment by default will be ren-
dered against you for the
relief demanded in the com-
plaint.
April 21, 2020
TALLEY LAW FIRM, P.A.
/s/ Scott F. Talley
Scott F. Talley, Esquire
134 Oakland Avenue
Spartanburg, S.C. 29302
Telephone: 864-595-2966
Attorneys for Plaintiff
scott@talleylawfirm.com
7-2, 9, 16

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
C/A No.: 2019-CP-42-01373

U.S. Bank, National Associa-
tion, Plaintiff, v. Oliver J.
Arthur Jr; Linda Whitmire;
Rufus M. Whitmire, III; Roy
Garland Whitmire; John William
Prather, III; Evelyn Arlie
Wright Clemo; Joseph L.
Wright; Any heirs-at-law or
devisees of Rufus Melvin
Whitmire Jr., deceased, their
heirs, Personal Representa-
tives, Administrators,
Successors and Assigns, and
all other persons or entities
entitled to claim through
them; all unknown persons or
entities with any right,
title, estate, interest in or
lien upon the real estate des-
cribed in the complaint here-
in; also any persons who may be
in the military service of the
United States of America,
being a class designated as
Richard Roe; and any unknown
minors, incompetent or impris-
oned person, or persons under
a disability being a class
designated as John Doe; Any
heirs-at-law or devisees of
Evelyn Garland Whitmire Rody,
deceased, their heirs,
Personal Representatives,
Administrators, Successors and
Assigns, and all other persons
or entities entitled to claim
through them; all unknown per-
sons or entities with any
right, title, estate, interest
in or lien upon the real estate
described in the complaint
herein; also any persons who
may be in the military service
of the United States of
America, being a class desig-
nated as Richard Roe; and any
unknown minors, incompetent or
imprisoned person, or persons
under a disability being a
class designated as John Doe.;
Any heirs-at-law or devisees
of David Roy Whitmire,
deceased, their heirs,
Personal Representatives,
Administrators, Successors and
Assigns, and all other persons
or entities entitled to claim
through them; all unknown per-
sons or entities with any
right, title, estate, interest
in or lien upon the real estate
described in the complaint
herein; also any persons who
may be in the military service
of the United States of
America, being a class desig-
nated as Richard Roe; and any
unknown minors, incompetent or
imprisoned person, or persons
under a disability being a
class designated as John Doe.;
Any heirs-at-law or devisees
of Montine W. Prather,
deceased, their heirs,
Personal Representatives,
Administrators, Successors and
Assigns, and all other persons
or entities entitled to claim
through them; all unknown per-
sons or entities with any
right, title, estate, interest
in or lien upon the real estate
described in the complaint
herein; also any persons who
may be in the military service
of the United States of
America, being a class desig-
nated as Richard Roe; and any
unknown minors, incompetent or
imprisoned person, or persons
under a disability being a
class designated as John Doe,
Defendant(s).

Summons and Noices
(Non-Jury) QUIET TITLE ACTION
TO THE DEFENDANT(S) ABOVE

NAMED:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to appear and defend
by answering the Complaint in
this action, a copy of which is
hereby served upon you, and to
serve a copy of your Answer on
the subscribers at their
offices at 3800 Fernandina
Road, Suite 110, Columbia, SC
29210, within thirty (30) days
after the service hereof,
exclusive of the day of such
service; except that the
United States of America, if
named, shall have sixty (60)
days to answer after the serv-
ice hereof, exclusive of the
day of such service; and if you
fail to do so, judgment by
default will be rendered
against you for the relief
demanded in the Complaint.

TO MINOR(S) OVER FOURTEEN
YEARS OF AGE, AND/OR TO
MINOR(S) UNDER FOURTEEN YEARS
OF AGE AND THE PERSON WITH WHOM
THE MINOR(S) RESIDES, AND/OR
TO PERSONS UNDER SOME LEGAL
DISABILITY:
YOU ARE FURTHER SUMMONED AND

NOTIFIED to apply for the
appointment of a guardian ad
litem within thirty (30) days
after the service of this
Summons and Notice upon you.
If you fail to do so, applica-
tion for such appointment will
be made by Attorney for Plain-
tiff.
YOU WILL ALSO TAKE NOTICE that
Plaintiff will move for an
Order of Reference or the
Court may issue a general
Order of Reference of this
action to a Master-in-Equity/
Special Referee, pursuant to
Rule 53 of the South Carolina
Rules of Civil Procedure.

Lis Pendens
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT an
action has been or will be com-
menced in this Court upon com-
plaint of the above-named

Plaintiff against the above-
named Defendant(s) to quiet
title to real property situat-
ed in Spartanburg County and
further described below:
ALL that certain lot or parcel
of land located, lying, and
being in the above mentioned
County and State, fronting on
the road leading from Monk’s
Grove Church to the County
Home road, and being shown on
a plat, Plat no. 2, of the
property of R.M. Whitmire,
Sr., made by W.N. Willis,
Engineer, December 22, 1952,
as Lot No. 3, and 50 foot lot
adjoining it on the North and
more particular described as
follows: Beginning at a point
on the East side of the road
leading from Monk’s Grove
Church to County Home road, at
the corner of Lot No. 2 on said
plat and running thence South
59.12 E 150 feet to a point on
Lot No. 4, thence running N
10.30 E with the lint of Lot
No. 4, 125 feet to the corner
of Lots Nos. 3 and 4; thence,
continuing in a line parallel
to the Monk’s Grove road 50
feet; thence, N. 88.27 W. 150
feet to a point on Monk’s Grove
Road; thence with the Eastern
edge of Monk’s Grove road 100
feet to the beginning corner.
Bounded on the North by prop-
erty of Florida Waddell; on
the East and South by property
of R.M. Whitmire, Sr. and on
the West by the road leading
from Monk’s Grove to the
County Home road.  Reference
being had to the above
described plat for a more per-
fect description.
AND
ALL that piece, parcel, and

lot of land beginning at an
iron pin at the intersection
of Lots Three, Ten, and
Twenty-Five, then continuing
S. 1-35 W for a distance of 50
feet to a point, then turning
S. 10-30 W. for a distance of
125 feet to a point, then turn-
ing S 85-33 W. for a distance
of 35.4 feet to a point, then
turning N. 1-25 E. for a dis-
tance of 175 feet to a point,
then turning North 87-27 West
to the point of beginning
(“Gap Parcel”), as better
shown on a Plat for Oliver Luke
Arthur dated August 18, 1966
and recorded November 10, 1966
in Plat Book 053 at Page 0405
with the Spartanburg County
Register of Deeds
TMS No. 2-55-10-026.00
Property Address: 935 Monks

Grove Church Road, Spartan-
burg, South Carolina 29303
Notice of Filing Complaint
TO THE DEFENDANTS ABOVE

NAMED:
YOU WILL PLEASE TAKE NOTICE

that the original Complaint,
Cover Sheet for Civil Actions
and Certificate of Exemption
from ADR in the above entitled
action was filed in the Office
of the Clerk of Court for Spar-
tanburg County on April 11,
2019. 

Order Appointing 
Guardian Ad Litem and
Appointment of Attorney

It appearing to the satisfac-
tion of the Court, upon read-
ing the filed Petition for
Appointment of Kelley Woody,
Esquire as Guardian ad Litem
for unknown minors, and per-
sons who may be under a dis-
ability, and it appearing that
Kelley Woody, Esquire has con-
sented to said appointment.

FURTHER upon reading the
filed Petition for Appointment
of Kelley Woody, Esquire as
Attorney for any unknown
Defendants who may be in the
Military Service of the United
States of America, and may be,
as such, entitled to the ben-
efits of the Servicemember’s
Civil Relief Act, and any
amendments thereto, and it
appearing that Kelley Woody,
Esquire has consented to act
for and represent said Defen-
dants, it is 
ORDERED that Kelley Woody,

P.O. Box 6432, Columbia, SC
29260 phone (803) 787-9678, be
and hereby is appointed Guard-
ian ad Litem on behalf of all
unknown minors and all unknown
persons who may be under a dis-
ability, all of whom may have
or claim to have some interest
or claim to the real property
commonly known as 935 Monks
Grove Church Road, Spartan-
burg, SC 29303; that he is
empowered and directed to
appear on behalf of and repre-
sent said Defendants, unless
said Defendants, or someone on
their behalf, shall within
thirty (30) days after service
of a copy hereof as directed,
procure the appointment of
Guardian or Guardians ad Litem
for said Defendants.
AND IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that
Kelley Woody, P.O. Box 6432,
Columbia, SC 29260 phone (803)
787-9678, be and hereby is
appointed Attorney for any
unknown Defendants who are, or
may be, in the Military
Service of the United States
of America and as such are
entitled to the benefits of
the Servicemember’s Civil
Relief Act aka Soldiers' and
Sailors' Civil Relief Act of
1940, and any amendments
thereto, to represent and pro-

tect the interest of said
Defendants,
AND IT IS FURTHER ORDERED
That a copy of this Order

shall be forth with served
upon said Defendants by publi-
cation in The Spartan Weekly,
a newspaper of general circu-
lation published in the County
of Spartanburg, State of South
Carolina, once a week for
three (3) consecutive weeks,
together with the Summons and
Notice of Filing of Complaint
in the above entitled action.
Brock & Scott, PLLC
3800 Fernandina Rd., Suite 110
Columbia, South Carolina 29210
Phone 844-856-6646 
Fax 803-454-3451 
Attorneys for Plaintiff
7-2, 9, 16

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
Case No.: 2019-CP-42-02228

Gerald J. Dogan, Plaintiff,
vs. Emilio Pastro, surviving
Director of Cash Flow Invest-
ments, Inc., Defendant.

Summons for Relief
TO THE DEFENDANT(S) ABOVE

NAMED:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Second
Amended Complaint in this
action, a copy of which is was
filed in the Office of the
Clerk of Court for Spartanburg
County on the 8th day of
January, 2020, and to serve a
copy of your Answer to said
Complaint upon the subscriber
at his office at 200 Ezell
Street, Spartanburg, S.C.
29306-2338, within thirty (30)
days after the service hereof,
exclusive of the day of such
service, and if you fail to
Answer the Complaint within
the time aforesaid, the Plain-
tiff in this action will apply
to the Court for the relief
demanded in the Complaint.
YOU WILL PLEASE TAKE NOTICE

that the original Summons and
Complaint and Lis Pendens were
filed in the Office of the
Clerk of Court for Spartanburg
County on the 19th day of June,
2019.
June 30, 2020
MAX B. CAUTHEN, JR.
Attorney for the Plaintiff
200 Ezell Street
Spartanburg, S.C. 29306
Phone: (864) 585-8797

Lis Pendens
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an
action has been commenced and
is pending in this Court upon
the Complaint of the above
named Plaintiff against the
above named Defendants to
clear the title to real estate
owned by Plaintiff, said prop-
erty is described as follows:
Block Map No.: 7-16-01-381.00
Address: 102 Westover Drive,
Spartanburg, South Carolina
All that lot, piece, or parcel
of land lying, being and sit-
uate in the City of Spartan-
burg, County of Spartanburg,
State of South Carolina on the
northeast side of Westover
Drive, known and described as
Lot No. 5, Block A-1 of the
Washington Heights Development
as shown on a plat by Gooch &
Taylor, Surveyors, dated
August 10, 1949 and recorded
in Plat Book 24, Pages 376-377
in the Office of the Register
of Deeds for Spartanburg
County, South Carolina. Said
property is further known as
102 Westover Drive. For a more
complete and accurate descrip-
tion, reference is hereby made
to the aforesaid plat. 
This being a portion of the

same property conveyed to Cash
Flow Investments, Inc., by
deed from Emilio Pastro dated
November 8, 2013 and recorded
on November 26, 2013 in Deed
Book 104-W at Page 285 in the
Office of the Register of
Deeds for Spartanburg County,
South Carolina.
June 19, 2020
s/ Max B. Cauthen, Jr.
MAX B. CAUTHEN, JR.
Attorney for the Plaintiff
200 Ezell Street
Spartanburg, S.C. 29306
Phone: (864) 585-8797
7-2, 9, 16

LEGAL NOTICE
On 6-23-2018, L&J Wrecker

Service of Spartanburg towed a
2001 Suzuki motorcycle, white
in color, from Highway 290 and
Rayhill Road. It was towed to
400 Ridgewood Avenue. VIN#
JS1DJ43A412101519. You have 30
days from the date of this
notice to call. Tow bill is
$175.00 and storage cost is
$34.00 per day. Please contact
L&J Wrecker Service, 400
Ridgeview Ave., Spartanburg,
SC 29306, phone 864-585-6686. 
June 23, 2018       7-2, 9, 16

LEGAL NOTICE
On 7-18-2018, L&J Wrecker

Service of Spartanburg towed a
1989 Chevrolet Caprice
Brougham, gray in color, from
Nazareth Church Road. It was
towed to 400 Ridgewood Avenue.
VIN# G1BU51E2KA139914. You
have 30 days from the date of
this notice to call. Tow bill
is $150.00 and storage cost is
$34.00 per day. Please contact
L&J Wrecker Service, 400

Ridgeview Ave., Spartanburg,
SC 29306, phone 864-585-6686. 
July 18, 2018       7-2, 9, 16

LEGAL NOTICE
On 12-20-2018, L&J Wrecker

Service of Spartanburg towed a
2008 Kawaski, black in color,
from Dan River Road. It was
towed to 400 Ridgewood Avenue.
VIN# JKAZXCE199AO21856. You
have 30 days from the date of
this notice to call. Tow bill
is $250.00 and storage cost is
$34.00 per day. Please contact
L&J Wrecker Service, 400
Ridgeview Ave., Spartanburg,
SC 29306, phone 864-585-6686. 
December 20, 2018   7-2, 9, 16

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
Case No.: 2020-CP-42-01736

306 Manning, LLC, Plaintiff,
vs. Noviello Properties, LLC,
Defendant.

Summons and Notices
(Suit to Quiet Title)

TO: DEFENDANT NOVIELLO PROP-
ERTIES, LLC
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint herein, which is incor-
porated herein by reference,
or to otherwise appear and
defend, and to serve a copy of
your Answer to said Complaint
upon the attorney for Plain-
tiff, George Brandt, III, HEN-
DERSON, BRANDT & VIETH, P.A.,
at their offices located at
360 E. Henry Street, Suite
101, Spartanburg, SC, 29302,
within thirty (30) days after
service hereof, exclusive of
the day of such service; and if
you fail to answer the Com-
plaint within the time afore-
said, or otherwise appear and
defend, the Plaintiff in this
action will apply to the Court
for the relief demanded there-
in, and judgment by default
will be rendered against you
for the relief demanded in the
Complaint. 

TO MINOR(S) OVER FOURTEEN
YEARS OF AGE, AND/OR TO
MINOR(S) UNDER FOURTEEN YEARS
OF AGE AND THE PERSON WITH WHOM
THE MINOR(S) RESIDES, AND/OR
TO PERSONS UNDER SOME LEGAL
DISABILITY:  
YOU ARE FURTHER SUMMONED AND

NOTIFIED to apply for the
appointment of a Guardian ad
Litem within thirty (30) days
after the service of this
Summons and Notice upon you.
If you fail to do so, applica-
tion for such appointment will
be made by the Plaintiff.
YOU WILL ALSO TAKE NOTICE that
the Plaintiff has moved and
was granted a general Order of
Reference to the Master in
Equity for Spartanburg County,
which Order does, pursuant to
Rule 53(b) of the South Caro-
lina Rules of Civil Procedure,
specifically provide that the
said Master In Equity is
authorized and empowered to
enter a final judgment in this
action.
July 6, 2020
HENDERSON, BRANDT & VIETH, P.A.
By: /s/ George Brandt, III                                   
George Brandt, III
South Carolina Bar No. 00855
Attorney for Plaintiffs
360 E. Henry St., Suite 101
Spartanburg, SC   29302
Phone: (864) 583-5144 / 
(864) 699-5773
Fax: (864) 582-2927
E-mail: gbrandt@hbvlaw.com
mloxley@hbvlaw.com
Notice of Filing Complaint
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

the original Summons and Com-
plaint in the above entitled
action, together with the
Summons, was filed in the
Office of the Clerk of Court
for Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, on May 28, 2020.
July 6, 2020
HENDERSON, BRANDT & VIETH, P.A.
By: /s/ George Brandt, III                                   
George Brandt, III
South Carolina Bar No. 00855
Attorney for Plaintiffs
360 E. Henry St., Suite 101
Spartanburg, SC   29302
Phone: (864) 583-5144 / 
(864) 699-5773
Fax: (864) 582-2927
E-mail: gbrandt@hbvlaw.com
mloxley@hbvlaw.com
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an
action has been commenced and
is now pending in this Court
upon Complaint of the above
named Plaintiff against the
above named Defendant for an
Order of this Court to pro-
claim the Plaintiff to be the
owner in fee simple of the
property described in the Com-
plaint, and that the Defendant
and all persons claiming under
it have no right, title,
estate, interest in or lien
upon said real estate whatso-
ever or any part thereof and
enjoining said Defendant and
all persons claiming under it
from asserting any adverse
claim to Plaintiff's title to
said real estate. The Property
at the time of the filing of
this Notice is described as
follows:
All that piece, parcel or lot

of land, with all improvements
thereon, situate, lying and
being in the State of South
Carolina, County of Spartan-
burg, being shown and desig-

nated as Lot 179 as shown on a
Plat for Spartan Mill Village
prepared by Pickell & Pickell,
said Plat being dated May 27,
1954 and recorded in Plat Book
31 at Pages 26-33 in the
Register of Deeds Office for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina.  For a more complete
and accurate description ref-
erence is hereby made to the
aforementioned Plat.
This is the same property con-
veyed to 306 Manning, LLC, a
South Carolina Limited Liabil-
ity Company, by Deed of Sergey
V. Tsibulskiy, dated March 19,
2020, and recorded on March
20, 2020 in Deed Book 127-J at
Pages 588-592, Register of
Deeds Office for Spartanburg
County, South Carolina. See
also prior Deed of record
recorded in Deed Book 125-S at
Page 905, Register of Deeds
Office for Spartanburg County,
South Carolina.
Block Map No. 7-12-05-251.00
Property Address: 306 Manning

Street, Spartanburg, SC 29303
July 6, 2020
HENDERSON, BRANDT & VIETH, P.A.
By: /s/ George Brandt, III               
George Brandt, III
South Carolina Bar No. 00855
Attorney for Plaintiffs
360 E. Henry St., Suite 101
Spartanburg, SC   29302
Phone: (864) 583-5144 / 
(864) 699-5773
Fax: (864) 582-2927
E-mail: gbrandt@hbvlaw.com
mloxley@hbvlaw.com
7-9, 16, 23

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE PROBATE COURT

IN THE MATTER OF ROCKY STEVEN
SIMS DANTZLER (Decedent)

Case Number: 2020ES4200759
Notice of Hearing

To: Unknown father of
JaAariana Goforth
Dated: September 3, 2020
Time: 3:00 p.m.
Place: Spartanburg County

Probate Court, 180 Magnolia
Street, Room 302, Spartanburg,
South Carolina 29306
Purpose of Hearing: Applica-

tion for Informal Appointment
Executed this 17th day of

June, 2020.
STARMEIKA WOFFORD
Post Office 766
Pacolet, South Carolina 29372
Telephone: (864) 921-3725
ptownstar@yahoo.com
Relationship to Decedent/
Estate: Daughter/Heir
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Janet Berry Stevens
Date of Death: April 2, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200704
Personal Representative:
David R. Stevens
1651 Old Hills Bridge Road
Enoree, SC 29335
Atty: Joseph K. Maddox, Jr.
Post Office Box 1702
Spartanburg, SC 29304
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Edna J. Hughes
Date of Death: April 8, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200665
Personal Representative:
Ms. Janice H. Sumerel
5580 Cross Anchor Road
Enoree, SC 29335
6-25, 7-2, 9
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 Legal Notices
NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES

All persons having claims
against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: George Allen Stepp
AKA George Tommy Stepp
Date of Death: May 4, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200736
Personal Representative:
Sarah Gosnell Kelly
923 Regina Road
Campobello, SC 29322
Atty: Michael James Sarratt
1500 East Rutherford Street
Landrum, SC 29356-0566
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Alfred D. Foster
AKA Alfred Dewitt Foster Jr.
AKA Chuck Dewitt Foster
Date of Death: March 25, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200605
Personal Representative:
Hazel Foster
189 Cromer Street
Roebuck, SC 29376
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Jewel S. Dunn
AKA Trixie Stewart Dunn
AKA Jewell S. Dunn
Date of Death: May 15, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200723
Personal Representative:
Ms. Jennie D. Thomas
110 Whispering Forest Lane
Woodruff, SC 29388
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Georgia Anne Otts
AKA G. Anne Otts
Date of Death: March 24, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200787
Personal Representative:

Ms. Joy O. Timmons
610 Houston Street
Spartanburg, SC 29303
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Betsy Hartman Cook
Date of Death: December 27, 2019
Case Number: 2020ES4200666
Personal Representative:
Mr. Carl Thomas Cook Jr.
220 Southwest Fieldsedge Drive
Moore, SC 29369
Atty: James B. Drennan III
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, SC 29304
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Larry Wilson Ellenburg
Date of Death: May 11, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200718
Personal Representative:
Evelyn DeEtte Ellenburg
202 Randolph Court
Woodruff, SC 29388
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Marian Moultrie Gilree
Date of Death: February 6, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200388
Personal Representative:
Mr. Calvin Bernard Gilree
212 Dallas Place
Spartanburg, SC 29306
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Thomas Ryan Humphries
Jr.
AKA Tommy R. Humphries Jr.
AKA Thomas Ryan Humphries
Date of Death: April 19, 2020

Case Number: 2020ES4200786
Personal Representative:
Ms. Donna H. Humphries
Post Office Box 43
Mayo, SC 29368
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Lonnie Estil Hapney,
Jr.
AKA Lonnie Estil Hapney
AKA Lonnie Hapney
Date of Death: August 10, 2019
Case Number: 2019ES4201755-2
Personal Representative:
Ms. Nancy J. Hapney
389 Crepe Myrtle Drive
Greer, SC 29651
Atty: Adam G. Lee
Post Office Box 1923
Greenville, SC 29602
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Bobby D. Jolley
AKA Bobby Dean Jolly
Date of Death: February 10, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200591
Personal Representative:
Mr. David C. Bullington
71 Casey Lane
Spartanburg, SC 29301
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Martha A. McMakin
Date of Death: April 1, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200702
Personal Representatives:
Mr. Billy Keith McMakin
3611 Highway 357
Inman, SC 29349     AND
Ms. Donna W. McMakin
16 Wild Cherry Circle
Lyman, SC 29365
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the

claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Hydrick D. Zimmerman Jr
Date of Death: April 27, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200623
Personal Representative:
Mr. Herbert W. Zimmerman
240 Burntwood Lane
Inman, SC 29349
6-25, 7-2, 9

LEGAL NOTICE
2020ES4200721

The Will of Polly Ruth Parker
Teaster, Deceased, was deliv-
ered to me and filed May 29,
2020. No proceedings for the
probate of said Will have
begun.
HON. PONDA A. CALDWELL
Judge, Probate Court for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
6-25, 7-2, 9

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Joseph Boncoddo
AKA Joseph E. Boncoddo
Date of Death: April 9, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200677
Personal Representative:
Mr. Michael A. Boncoddo
509 East Tara Lane
Duncan, SC 29334
7-2, 9, 16

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Thomas Douglas Lindsey
Date of Death: May 9, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200675
Personal Representative:
Ms. Carolyn R. Lindsey
446 Edwards Road
Lyman, SC 29365
7-2, 9, 16

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Lois Edna Yarbrough
Date of Death: February 18, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200673
Personal Representative:
Ms. Robin Johnson
Post Office Box 302
Roebuck, SC 29376
7-2, 9, 16

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier

(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: JoAnn F. Eastes
Date of Death: May 21, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200734
Personal Representative:
Barbara Lee Eastes
4066 Angeline Court
Santa Rosa, CA 95405
7-2, 9, 16

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Shirley J. Lippert
Date of Death: April 8, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200822
Personal Representative:
Luther A. Lippert, Sr.
506 Royal Oaks Drive
Spartanburg, SC 29302
Atty: David L. Walsh
Post Office Box 5156
Spartanburg, SC 29304
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Donell Cohen
AKA Donell Cohens
Date of Death: March 19, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200531
Personal Representative:
Ms. Katie V. Cohen
203 Weston Valley Drive
Moore, SC 29369
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Dianne Greer Babb
Date of Death: April 5, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200847
Personal Representative:
Mr. Charles H. Babb
50 Ridge Road
Lyman, SC 29365
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier

(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Don S. Blair
Date of Death: April 21, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200797
Personal Representative:
Catherine C. Blair
338 Indian Summer Lane
Boiling Springs, SC 29316
Atty: Stanley Michael Pack Jr.
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, SC 29304
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Eddie Lee Herbert
Date of Death: June 2, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200884
Personal Representative:
Mr. John D. Herbert
341 Worthington Circle
Spartanburg, SC 29303
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Howard Lawson Yelton
Date of Death: May 17, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200792
Personal Representative:
Mr. Travis Howard Yelton
205 Rolleston Drive
Greenville, SC 29615
Atty: Scott Franklin Talley
134 Oakland Avenue
Spartanburg, SC 29302
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Judy Cox Watkins
AKA Judy G. Birkhimer
AKA Judy G. Cox
Date of Death: May 18, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200823
Personal Representative:
Ms. Melaine Holland
592 Cromwell Drive
Spartanburg, SC 29301
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date 
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of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Alastair C. Walker
Date of Death: May 4, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200774
Personal Representatives:
David Walker
121 Ridgewood Drive
Inman, SC 29349       AND
Martha Blackstone
237 Pineville Road
Spartanburg, SC 29307
Atty: Alan M. Tewkesbury Jr.
220 North Church St., Suite 4
Spartanburg, SC 29306
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Marjorie L. Confer
Date of Death: January 8, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200166
Personal Representative:
Mr. Joseph Freehling
340 S. Monterey Drive
Moore, SC 29369
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: James Mardell Eubanks

AKA Jimmy Eubanks
Date of Death: January 28, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200243
Personal Representative:
Mr. James Michael Eubanks
105 Gwendolyn Avenue
Lyman, SC 29365
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Henry G. Kelley, Jr.
Date of Death: June 6, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200876
Personal Representative:
Ms. Marilyn M. Kelley
1018 Four Mile Branch Road
Spartanburg, SC 29302
Atty: James W. Shaw
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, SC 29304
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Larry Rigby Foster
Date of Death: April 4, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200638
Personal Representative:
Ms. Thelma R. Foster
401 Pearson Road
Greer, SC 29651
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date

of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Emma Jean Eubanks
Date of Death: July 8, 2019
Case Number: 2020ES4200242
Personal Representative:
Mr. James Michael Eubanks
105 Gwendolyn Avenue
Lyman, SC 29365
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of

this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Sally Hunter Thompson
Date of Death: June 22, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200900
Personal Representative:
Matthew Ryan Thompson
309 Watercrest Drive
Inman, SC 29349
7-9, 16, 23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within

eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Lois Darlee Beach
Date of Death: January 16, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200920
Personal Representative:
Mr. Marvin Winfred Beach
358 Old Clark Road
Inman, SC 29349
Atty: Lawrence E. Flynn, Jr.
350 East St. John Street
Spartanburg, SC 29302
7-9, 16, 23

LEGAL NOTICE
2020ES4200714

The Will of Congettia Anne
Leso AKA Anne Leso, Deceased,

was delivered to me and filed
May 29, 2020. No proceedings
for the probate of said Will
have begun.
HON. PONDA A. CALDWELL
Judge, Probate Court for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
7-9, 16, 23

LEGAL NOTICE
2020ES4200814

The Will of Kathleen W.
Layton, Deceased, was delivered
to me and filed June 1, 2020.
No proceedings for the probate
of said Will have begun.
HON. PONDA A. CALDWELL
Judge, Probate Court for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
7-9, 16, 23

LEGAL NOTICE
2020ES4200887

The Will of Frances Lawson
Roper, Deceased, was delivered
to me and filed June 25, 2020.
No proceedings for the probate
of said Will have begun.
HON. PONDA A. CALDWELL
Judge, Probate Court for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
7-9, 16, 23
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