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Big South Conference 

delays fall seasons; targets spring

Charlotte, N.C. – With the health and well-being of its
student-athletes as its top priority, the Big South
Conference announced on August 12 that it is delaying
its fall sports seasons with the intent of playing in the
spring. This includes the sports of men’s and women’s
cross country, football, men’s and women’s soccer, and
volleyball. Additionally, fall competitions in the sports
of men’s and women’s golf and men’s and women’s ten-
nis, and out of season competitions in spring sports have
been suspended as well. Football members will be
allowed to participate in up to four non-conference
games in the fall due to contractual obligations.

Big South member institutions may continue with per-
missible athletics activities, as defined by NCAA regula-
tions and with the exception of fall sport competition, at
their own discretion and in accordance with applicable
local and state regulations and procedures.

A special surprise for some special educators

Spartanburg School District Two recently held their
Welcome Back Convocation. The difference this year, is
that school teams watched a live-streamed ceremony at
their individual buildings on the District YouTube page. 

As part of the celebration, the District announced the
Teacher of the Year and Ambassador of the Year, and sur-
prised them at their school with some awesome gifts
thanks to a pair of generous community partners. 

The Teacher of the Year is 4th grade teacher Michelle
Monroe from Cooley Springs-Fingerville Elementary
School. She received a check for $3000 courtesy of
Thompson Turner Construction (builders of the new
Boiling Springs High School).

The Ambassador of the Year is Spanish Language
Interpreter Maria Obando from Hendrix Elementary
School. She received a check for $1500 courtesy of
Founders Federal Credit Union.

Spartanburg businesses taking action

RJ Rockers Brewery and Ameri-Mask have taken the
Spartanburg Mask Challenge to new heights with an
oversized mask on Rockers' signature Silo. RJ Rockers
is also donating $1 from every 32 oz. Crowler sale to the
Bringing Back the Burg Small Business Fund. What bet-
ter excuse to pick up some locally-brewed beer than sup-
porting a good cause while you're at it?

Spartanburg businesses commit to 

combating COVID-19

More than 160 businesses – ranging from hospitality to
manufacturing to professional services – have made the
commitment to combat COVID-19. Thanks to a dona-
tion from BMW Plant Spartanburg, committed business-
es can receive up to 50 free face masks.

In addition to following CDC & DHEC industry-spe-
cific guidelines, businesses are helping to Bring Back
the 'Burg safely by following these steps:

1. Screen Team Members: Monitoring employee
health before each shift

2. Wear Masks: All staff will wear face coverings when
social distancing is not possible

3. Hand Safety: Hand sanitizers and wash stations are
available

4. Clean Environment: Cleaning thoroughly between
guests 

5. Provide Space: Following social distancing and
capacity guidelines

Make your commitment at BringingBacktheBurg.com

Fry’s fantastic summer continues

For the third consecutive week in July USC Upstate
senior golfer Hunter Fry (Dacula, Ga.) found himself in
the top-10 of an amateur tournament, this week it hap-
pened to be at the Georgia Open Qualifier at
Chattahoochee golf course.

In the one round event, Fry had a runner-up finish with
a final score of 67 (-5). The Peach State native, led the
field on the front nine, shooting four-under par and he
led the field in par-5 scoring with a three-under par
round. Once again, Fry led the tournament with a seven
birdie round. For the sixth consecutive year, Fry has
qualified for the Georgia Open.

“This summer has been a continuation of my spring
season,” Fry said. “I was playing really well right before
everything shutdown, so I’ve just been trying to pick
back up where I left off. I was hitting the ball very well
at the Spartanburg County Amateur Tournament last
weekend. I’m really looking forward to getting back out
there and seeing if I can give it a good run this year.”

Steaks are one of the most

popular types of grilled meats.

Chuck steaks are a tasty alter-

native to more expensive

steaks. While not as tender as

other steaks, chuck steaks are

favorably enhanced by mari-

nating them before grilling.

Whether cooked in a skillet,

broiled or grilled, chuck steaks

are best when cooked for a few

minutes per side, allowed to

rest for 5 minutes, and served

medium rare. Longer cooking

times will make the meat

tough.

GRILLED FLAT IRON

STEAKS WITH GARLIC

MARINADE

Don't add salt when making

this marinade. Sprinkle the

steaks with a teaspoon of salt

right before placing them on

the grill. If using the marinade

as a salad dressing, sprinkle the

salt on the salad greens first

then add the marinade. Makes

approximately 2 1/4 cups.

6 (1/2-pound each) flat iron

or chuck eye steaks

1 cup extra virgin olive oil

1/2 cup soy sauce

1/3 cup red wine vinegar

1/4 cup fresh squeezed

lemon juice

3 tablespoons

Worcestershire sauce

1 tablespoon black pepper

2 tablespoons Dijon mustard

1 tablespoon onion powder

1 tablespoon garlic powder

1/2 tablespoon paprika

1/4 teaspoon red pepper

flakes

1. Place the steaks in a shal-

low baking dish. Using a medi-

um-sized bowl, stir together the

oil, soy sauce, vinegar, lemon

juice, Worcestershire sauce,

pepper, mustard, onion pow-

der, garlic powder, paprika and

red pepper flakes until well-

combined. 

2. Pour all but about a 1/4

cup of the marinade over the

steaks. Reserve the marinade

in the bowl for later use and set

it aside. Turn the steaks in the

pan to coat on both sides.

Cover the dish with plastic

wrap. Let the steaks marinate at

room temperature for 10 min-

utes. 

3. Heat the grill to medium-

high heat. Oil the grill grate

with a paper-towel dipped in

vegetable oil to clean the grill

and keep the steaks from stick-

ing. Remove steaks from dish.

Aggressively sprinkle both

sides of the steak with salt to

create a flavorful crust. 

4. Place steaks on the cooler

part of the grill, over medium

heat. Cook steaks for 4 to 5

minutes on each side, brushing

steaks often with the reserved

marinade.

5. After the steaks have

cooked on both sides, remove

them from the heat and cover

with a piece of foil to keep

them warm. The steaks will

stay warm and continue to

cook. Allow the steaks to rest

for 5 minutes before slicing to

retain the juices and keep it ten-

der and moist. Serve immedi-

ately.

Angela Shelf Medearis is an
award-winning children's
author, culinary historian, and
the author of seven cookbooks. 

(c) 2020 King Features

Synd., Inc., and Angela Shelf

Medearis
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grilled steaks
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Logan Pace and Upstate women’s soccer

spend their summer giving back

After organizing and

executing a successful

food drive earlier this sum-

mer that yielded over 380

pounds of canned goods to

local food banks, the USC

Upstate women’s soccer

team continued to reach

out and serve in their local

communities.

Recently USC Upstate

junior goalkeeper Logan

Pace (Belmont, N.C.) has

been working with

Elevation Outreach and

their annual “Love Week”

events. The church’s annu-

al love week reaches local

communities from the

Southeastern United

States, all the way across

the northern border to

Toronto, Canada.

“If you know Logan, you

know that she wears her

heart on her sleeve and she

has such a passion for peo-

ple,” USC Upstate Asso-

ciate A.D. for Student-

Athlete Enrichment and

SWA Sarah Gildersleeve

said. “Having the opportu-

nity to hear her stories all

summer then getting the

opportunity to see her in

action and serve alongside

her last week at Love

Week has been so inspir-

ing.”

Pace is very passionate

about her volunteer work

and the reach that

Elevation Outreach has

had on her local communi-

ty. “Serving with the peo-

ple I love for the commu-

nity I love has been the

best experience of my

life,” Pace said. Through

the help and organization

of Pace, the women’s soc-

cer team has driven the 74

miles to Charlotte from

Spartanburg to volunteer

alongside their fellow

teammate. 

For Pace, however, this

is not the first week she

has volunteered this sum-

mer. In fact, the Tar Heel

State native has volun-

teered every day since

April 17 and has accumu-

lated over 400 hours of

service. A few places that

Pace has worked this sum-

mer include local food

drives in both Charlotte

and Winston-Salem, the

Dream Center (Charlotte,

N.C.), Nation Ford

Elementary School (Char-

lotte, N.C.) and the Second

Harvest Food Bank

(Winston-Salem, N.C.).

Through Elevation

Outreach, Pace also volun-

teered her time in

Talladega, Ala. with the

Convoy of Hope and the

Joey Logano foundation.

The Convoy of Hope,

founded in 1994, is a non-

profit organization that

focuses on feeding the

world through children’s

feeding initiatives, com-

munity outreaches, and

disaster response. The

Joey Logano Foundation

invests in organizations

offering second chances to

children and young adults

during times of crisis and

works to inspire others to

live a life of generosity.

The junior also volun-

teered her time with the

nonprofit pharmacy Med-

Assist, which helps pri-

mary low-income patients

with medical and medica-

tion bills. One of the final

places that Pace worked

was at the A21 Founda-

tion, a non-profit organiza-

tion that is working to end

human trafficking across

the globe.  

“Getting to know so

many people and hearing

so many amazing stories

has affected me on a deep

level,” Pace replied. “I

can’t wait to take all of

that back to the soccer

field and to my teammates.

I have learned that right

outside of USC Upstate

people need help. I took

heart to seeing each person

intentionally.”

“Logan has grown so

much over the past year

and it has been awesome

to see her find her passion

in serving others,” Gilder-

sleeve stated. “She serves

in various leadership roles

within student-athlete

organizations, including

SAAC (Student-Athlete

Advisement Committee)

and FCA (Fellowship of

Christian Athletes), and

I’m looking forward to her

bringing her experience

from Elevation Outreach

to Upstate. I’m so proud of

Logan and am excited to

see how she continues

impacting our Upstate and

Spartanburg communi-

ties.”
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Spartanburg Medical Center ranked

as No. 2 hospital in South Carolina

Spartanburg Medical

Center has been recog-

nized as a Best Hospital

for 2020-21 by U.S. News

& World Report.  

Spartanburg Medical

Center is ranked as the No.

2 hospital in South Caro-

lina and is recognized as

one of the Best Hospitals

in the Upstate of S.C.  

“In the midst of a pan-

demic, it is gratifying to be

recognized for our hard

work,” said Spartanburg

Medical Center President

Phil Feisal. “Each and

every day, our medical

professionals work hard to

provide excellent care and

keep our community

healthy.”  

In addition to being

ranked No. 2 in the state,

Spartanburg Medical

Center was also ranked as

“high performing” in the

following adult procedures

and conditions:  

* Aortic valve surgery  

* Chronic obstructive

pulmonary disease

(COPD)  

* Colon cancer surgery  

* Heart bypass surgery  

* Heart failure  

* Hip replacement  

* Knee replacement  

* Lung cancer surgery  

The annual Best Hos-

pitals rankings and ratings,

now in their 31st year, are

designed to assist patients

and their doctors in mak-

ing informed decisions

about where to receive

care for challenging health

conditions or for common

elective procedures.  

For the 2020-21 rankings

and ratings, U.S. News

evaluated more than 4,500

medical centers nation-

wide in 16 specialties, 10

procedures and conditions.

In the 16 specialty areas,

134 hospitals were ranked

in at least one specialty. In

rankings by state and

metro area, U.S. News rec-

ognized best regional hos-

pitals based on high per-

forming rankings across

multiple areas of care.  

“For more than 30 years,

U.S. News & World

Report has been helping

patients, along with the

help of their physicians,

identify the Best Hospitals

in an array of specialties,

procedures and condi-

tions,” said Ben Harder,

managing editor and chief

of health analysis at U.S.

News. “The hospitals that

rise to the top of our rank-

ings and ratings have deep

medical expertise, and

each has built a track

record of delivering good

outcomes for patients.”  

The U.S. News Best

Hospitals methodologies

in most areas of care are

based largely on objective

measures such as risk-

adjusted survival and dis-

charge-to-home rates, vol-

ume, and quality of nurs-

ing, among other care-

related indicators.

Spartanburg Medical Center was recently

ranked as the No. 2 hospital in South Carolina

by U.S. News & World Report.
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Around the Upstate
S.C. Technical College System building a workforce

People, and the strength

of the workforce they

make up, are at the core of

economic development.

And in South Carolina, it’s

hard to talk “workforce”

without the SC Technical

College System, a network

of 16 technical colleges

across the state that is

nationally recognized for

programs such as readySC

and Apprenticeship

Carolina.

Whether it’s readySC

helping to train employees

at new industries or

Apprenticeship Carolina™

offering “earn while you

learn” opportunities, these

programs and the Upstate

institutions Greenville

Technical College, Spar-

tanburg Community

College, Tri-County Tech-

nical College and Pied-

mont Technical College

are key to supporting

Upstate employer’s needs.

And, as the economy

rebounds from the disrup-

tion of the COVID-19 pan-

demic with 12.5% state-

wide unemployment

reported for May 2020,

these institutions are

resources for those dis-

placed from restaurant,

retail and other service

industry jobs, unlocking

opportunities to up their

skills and wages.

During a May 27 Coffee

& (Tele)Conversation

webinar, system president

Dr. Tim Hardee spoke

about how the system sup-

ports employers, its

response to COVID-19,

and what’s on the horizon. 

The SC Technical

College System

The system serves an

average of 100,000 credit-

seeking and 60,000 contin-

uing education students

statewide, keeping price

points as affordable as pos-

sible, with locations ready

to serve all South Caro-

linians within a 30-minute

drive.

Courses and programs

are geared toward jobs that

exist in South Carolina, as

demonstrated by the fact

that 90% of system grads

are placed in their field of

study within a year of

graduation.

readySC & 

E-Zone Workforce 

Training and Support

readySC is the training

program that supports

industries as they enter the

state, and a range of com-

panies from Michelin to

BMW and Boeing – and

many smaller companies –

have benefited from it.

For employers imple-

menting readySC training,

such as Volvo and

Mercedes-Benz Vans, pro-

grams were paused during

the early stages of the pan-

demic. Now, with added

PPE, social distancing, and

handwashing, the program

is back up and running.

For companies who piv-

oted to respond to critical

need items – introducing

new processes as a result

of modified operations, the

Ezone program offers

helps to offset training

costs.

The E-Zone program

offers financial support for

incumbent worker training

on new technology or

processes, offering up to

66% in savings on training

costs. The program has

been activated by a num-

ber of businesses who

adapted their production to

meet critical item demands

in response to COVID-19.

On any given day,

readySC is working with

approximately 115 proj-

ects across the state. Last

year, they recruited and

trained just over 5,000

people for jobs in the state.

EZone is a System pro-

gram that offers an incen-

tive to companies for train-

ing incumbent workers.

Last year, 78 companies

across the state took

advantage of this program

with nearly 30,000 South

Carolinians eligible for

retraining.

“We certainly have had a

lot of those companies

who have gotten involved

in producing masks, PPE

and hand sanitizer,”

Hardee said.

The 16 colleges transi-

tioned quickly to online

course delivery, using the

existing system that previ-

ously allowed one-third of

courses to be offered

online.

One hurdle the system

overcame: working with

the Governor’s Office and

the State Board of Nursing

to enable 1,100 nurses to

complete their clinical

coursework using online

simulations, so that they

could graduate and enter

the workforce.

Apprenticeship

Carolina Fosters 

On-the-Job Learning

Another growing success

for the system: the

Apprenticeship Carolina™

program, which offers

companies consultation

services in launching fed-

erally-qualified appren-

ticeship programs.

“It’s nice to be viewed as

the place that other states

come to see how we do it.

Our apprenticeship pro-

gram has grown extensive-

ly over the last 12-15

years. And, we have start-

ed to delve even more into

Youth Apprenticeship

Programs,” Hardee said.

The system has served

34,000+ apprentices with

more than 1,067 registered

programs, and another 235

youth apprenticeships have

been established.

The program’s core com-

ponents include a job-

related education, super-

vised on-the-job learning,

and a scalable wage pro-

gression. And, the average

tenure among employees

who have completed

apprenticeships is 3.6

years longer than those

who have not.

More than 1,000 occupa-

tions can be part of the

program, including:

advanced manufacturing,

construction technologies,

healthcare, information

technology, tourism &

service industries, trans-

portation & logistics, and

energy & utilities.

Employers can take

advantage of a $1,000 per

apprentice per year for up

to four years.

Overcoming

Workforce Shortages

with SC WINS,

ManuFirst and

Statewide Marketing

And, apprenticeships

aren’t the only way the

system is engaging the

emerging talent pipeline.

Last year, nearly 11,000

students took advantage of

the new SC WINS (the

Carolina Workforce

Industry Needs Scholar-

ship) scholarship program,

which supplements

Lottery Tuition Assistance

and additional scholar-

ships to increase enroll-

ment in programs that train

for high-demand fields.

Six areas were identified:

Advanced Manufacturing,

Healthcare, IT and

Computer Technology,

Construction, Hospitality

and Tourism, and Trans-

portation, Distribution and

Logistics.

Another program with

room to grow: ManuFirst,

a certificate program

designed to meet Volvo’s

hiring needs of 4,000 peo-

ple by offering a 62-hour

training course on team-

work, safety and OHSA

requirements that the car-

maker used in lieu of

required one-year of man-

ufacturing experience.

“I would see us expand-

ing that quite a bit across

the state in the coming

year,” Hardee said.

And, there’s a new $1.5

million, 3-year statewide

marketing initiative, I

DEFY, in the works geared

toward igniting interest in

manufacturing among ris-

ing high-school seniors.

Developing Future

Talent

With such rapid change

in the economy – and edu-

cation delivery – in the

first half of 2020, how

does the system’s fall

look?

“Historically, when

unemployment goes up,

we have more students,”

Hardee said, “when we

have lower than 3% unem-

ployment, enrollment goes

down.”

Hardee acknowledged

that some jobs lost in

tourism and hospitality

may not return quickly,

though openings in health-

care and manufacturing

may offer different oppor-

tunities.

The system anticipates a

return to in-person instruc-

tion – especially in fields

that require hands-on

learning – though with

modifications that allow

for physical distancing.

“We’re encouraged that

the fall semester is going

to be a good one for the

system, but what that num-

ber is, I can’t really tell

you now.”
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Tips to help erase bullying this back-to-school season
(StatePoint) This back-

to-school season may look

a little different, but no

matter what learning envi-

ronment kids find them-

selves in this fall, bullying

is a real cause for concern. 

One in five kids aged 12

to 18 has encountered bul-

lying, according to

StopBullying.gov. It can

happen in person, online or

even by text. In an effort to

combat the problem, Pilot

Pen launched the Erase

Bullying for Good cam-

paign in 2015 to help sup-

port bullying prevention

programs in schools

nationwide. For a smooth

start to the school year,

they are offering parents

these back-to-school tips

for facing the issue:

• Sometimes kids hesi-

tate to share negative situ-

ations they’re encounter-

ing. That doesn’t mean

they aren’t showing signs

that something is wrong.

Pay attention to sudden

changes in mood, sleep

patterns, study habits or

other signs of stress. Let

kids know that if they’re

bullied or witness bully-

ing, it’s okay to come to

you or another trusted

adult, like a teacher, coun-

selor or coach. A strong

trust network helps kids

feel safe and empowered.

• If your child is being

bullied, reassure them that

they’re not alone and have

done nothing wrong. Let

them know you’ll work

through this together.

Follow up with school

officials to ensure the neg-

ative behavior is being

addressed, especially if

your child is being physi-

cally bullied or feels like

they’re in danger.

• The presence of digital

devices and broad reach of

social media means more

avenues for bullies to

reach their targets.

Maintain an open dialogue

with your child regarding

online activity, and don’t

be shy about keeping an

eye on profiles and posts.

• Being the target of bul-

lying can feel isolating and

overwhelming. If your

child witnesses bullying,

encourage them to be an

“upstander,” not just a

bystander. This involves

being an ally who stands

up to bullies, and it can be

as simple as seeking help

from an adult, or as ambi-

tious as starting an anti-

bullying program at

school.

• It can be disheartening

to learn that your own

child has engaged in bully-

ing. Remember, bullying is

a behavior, and behaviors

can be changed. Help your

child identify underlying

feelings that may be caus-

ing them to act out in this

way and encourage them

to find positive outlets

such as sports, art or jour-

naling.

• It’s important for kids

to understand that the goal

of bullying is to make the

victim feel scared or pow-

erless. Parents can equip

children with the knowl-

edge, resources and confi-

dence they need to feel

empowered in the face of

bullying, as well as with

tools that align with this

cause. By the end of 2020,

the Erase Bullying for

Good campaign, through

purchases of Pilot’s

FriXion Erasable pens,

will have contributed more

than $450,000 to organiza-

tions committed to bring-

ing bullying prevention

and education programs to

US schools. FriXion’s

unique, thermo-sensitive

erasable ink writes

smoothly and erases clean-

ly, so students, teachers

and parents can write, cre-

ate and express themselves

fearlessly without the

stress of written mistakes,

empowering them to be

upstanders through the

written word. To learn

more, visit

HelpEraseBullying.com.

Bullying is all too com-

mon. However, parents

can play an active role in

helping put a stop to it this

back-to-school season and

beyond.

Columbia — In an effort

to give back to the commu-

nity in response to the

COVID-19 pandemic, the

nonprofit South Carolina

State Fair will host its first-

ever free, Drive-Through

S.C. State Fair on Tuesday,

Oct. 20 and Wednesday,

Oct. 21. Find details lead-

ing up to the event at

www.scstatefair.org and

follow @scstatefair on

social media.

“In the midst of the worst

global crisis of our life-

time, we wanted to give

the community something

positive to look forward

to,” said General Manager

Nancy Smith, who also

serves as the current chair

of the International

Association of Fairs and

Exhibitions (IAFE). “Our

team is proud to offer a

free event where families

and friends can experience

the joy of the State Fair in

a safe and fun environ-

ment.”

Guests will enjoy free

admission to drive through

the fairgrounds and experi-

ence unique, car-friendly

attractions that highlight

South Carolina’s agricul-

ture, history, arts and cul-

ture — all from the com-

fort and safety of their

cars. Meanwhile, in a twist

on the restaurant drive-

through concept, guests

will be able to drive into

the Lexington Medical

Center Fair Park on the

fairgrounds and purchase

their favorite fair foods. 

“The Drive-Through

State Fair is going to give

folks a snippet of the fair

they’ve known their entire

lives,” said Smith. “It will

certainly look different,

but we look forward to

sharing this gift with the

community. It will truly be

a year like no other.”

While rides will not be

on the menu in 2020 due to

safety precautions, the

organization has devised a

creative, family-friendly

way to experience the

food, exhibits, crafts and

animals for which the S.C.

State Fair is known and

loved — in a safe environ-

ment.

“As the state’s largest

event, we have a responsi-

bility to take care of our

neighbors and protect

those we love,” said

Smith. “To prioritize com-

munity health and well-

being, our team has spent

countless hours develop-

ing the best and safest

State Fair possible. Safety

is always our number one

concern, and it is clear to

us that the State Fair must

adapt to the challenges of

the COVID-19 pandemic.”

The State Fair is dedicat-

ed to using its facilities and

resources to support and

serve the community.

Earlier this year, the fair-

grounds hosted S.C.

DHEC and Kroger

Health’s free COVID-19

testing and Richland

County’s annual Richland

Recycles collection day.

Historically, a wide variety

of community service

functions have been pro-

vided by the fair’s facili-

ties during emergencies,

and the State Fair team

intends to continue this tra-

dition.

“As a 501c3 nonprofit

organization ourselves, we

exist to serve the commu-

nity, and we understand

the toll that the coron-

avirus is taking on family

farms, concessionaires,

exhibitors, small business-

es, community groups and

countless others,” said

Smith. “I’d like to recog-

nize our fellow fairs, here

in South Carolina and

across North America and

beyond, that are also mak-

ing difficult decisions to

best serve their communi-

ties. Our state is SC

Strong, and our fair com-

munity is Fair Strong.”

The public is encouraged

to submit stories, photos

and videos of their “Prize-

Winning Memories” from

S.C. State Fairs of the past.

The State Fair will share

these images on social

media in October 2020 —

and they might even be

seen at the Drive-Through

State Fair — to highlight

the unforgettable moments

that create the largest event

in the state. Photos, quotes

and videos are now being

accepted via email at

favoritememory@scstate-

fair.org.

“We’ve been bringing

folks together for 150

years, and we plan on

being here to continue our

beloved tradition for

decades to come,” said

Smith. “Thank you for

standing by us now, and

thank you for keeping the

spirit alive as we bring

your tradition — your

South Carolina State Fair

— to you in a new way this

October. We’ll be back —

better and stronger — in

2021.”

Next year’s S.C. State

Fair will take place

October 13-24, 2021.

The South Carolina State

Fair, a self-supporting

501(c)3 nonprofit organi-

zation, was organized in

1869 and is dedicated to

preserving and promoting

South Carolina’s agricul-

tural roots while support-

ing statewide education.

The South Carolina State

Fair has awarded more

than $4 million in scholar-

ships since 1997.

First-ever, free drive-through S.C. State Fair to be held October 20 - 21

***** Please note

that all events

through July 31

have been can-

celled due to

COVID-19. Please

visit www.cityof

spartanburg.org

for more 

information. *****
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Legal Notices
MASTER’S SALE

2020-CP-42-01312
BY VIRTUE of a decree hereto-

fore granted in the case of:
Jennifer Jeter v. Michael E.
Hawes and United States of
America, acting through its
Agency, Department of Treasury
- Internal Revenue Service,
the undersigned Gordon G.
Cooper, Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, will sell
on September 8, 2020 at 11:00
a.m., at the Library Street
Entrance of the County
Judicial Center, 180 Magnolia
Street, Spartanburg, South
Carolina to the highest bid-
der: 
All that certain piece, par-

cel or lot of land situate,
lying and being in the County
of Spartanburg, State of South
Carolina, shown and designated
as Lot No. 27 in Section Con
Plat of Lakeview Manor Subdi-
vision, recorded in Plat Book
65, Page 58-60, in the Office
of the Register of Deeds for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, reference to which
is made for the purpose of pro-
viding a more particular des-
cription of said property. 
Tax Map No.: 3-05-15-100.00 
TERMS OF SALE: FOR CASH. The

Master in Equity will require
a deposit of 5% of the bid
amount in cash or certified
funds, which is to be applied
on the purchase price upon
compliance with the bid.
Interest on the balance of the
bid at 6% shall be paid to the
day of compliance. In case of
noncompliance within 20 days,
after the sale, the deposit of
5% is to be forfeited and
applied to Plaintiff s judg-
ment debt and the property re-
advertised for sale upon the
same terms at the risk of the
former highest bidder. Pur-
chaser to pay for recording
fees and deed stamps. 
The bidding will not remain

open after the date of sale,
but compliance with the bid
may be made immediately. 
Should Petitioner, Petition-

er’s attorney, or Petitioner’s
agent fail to appear on the day
of sale, the property shall
not be sold, but shall be re-
advertised and sold at some
convenient sales day there-
after when Petitioner, Peti-
tioner’s attorney, or Peti-
tioner’s agent is present. 
The sale shall be subject to

taxes and assessments, exist-
ing easements and easements
and restrictions of record. 
Petitioner does not warrant

its title search to purchasers
or other third parties, who
should have their own title
search performed on the sub-
ject property.
RYAN GAYLORD
Attorney for Plaintiff
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
8-20, 27, 9-3

MASTER’S SALE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
Case No.: 2020-CP-42-00440

Vanderbilt Mortgage and
Finance, Inc., Plaintiff, vs.
Robert A. Cenicola, Defen-
dant(s).

Notice of Sale
BY VIRTUE of a judgment here-

tofore granted in the case of
Vanderbilt Mortgage and
Finance, Inc. vs. Robert A.
Cenicola, I, Gordon G. Cooper
Master in Equity for Spartan-
burg County, will sell on
September 8, 2020 at 11:00
a.m., at the Spartanburg
County Judicial Center, 180
Magnolia Street, Spartanburg,
SC 29306, to the highest bid-
der:
BEING all of Lot 11 as shown

on that plat for Cook Estates
section 2 filed at Plat Book
11, Page 5 of the Spartanburg
County Register of Deeds.
This being all of that prop-

erly conveyed to Robert A.
Cenicola by that deed of Susan
Cooke Ruetz dated 11/15/2017
recorded on November 28, 2017
in Book 117V at Page 234.
TMS #: 1-26-11-008.00

140 Skyline Drive, Campo-
bello, SC 29322
Mobile Home: 2018 CLAY VIN:

CLM102203TN 
SUBJECT TO SPARTANBURG COUNTY
TAXES
TERMS OF SALES The successful

bidder, other than the Plain-
tiff, will deposit with the
Master In Equity at conclusion
of the bidding, five (5%) of
his bid, in cash or equiva-
lent, as evidence of good
faith, the same to be applied
to purchase price in case of
compliance, but to be forfeit-
ed and applied first to costs
and then to Plaintiffs debt in
the case of noncompliance.
Should the last and highest
bidder fail or refuse to make
the required deposit at the
time of the bid or comply with
the other terms or the bid
within twenty (20) days, then
the Master In Equity may
resell the property on the
same terms and conditions on
some subsequent Sales Day (at
the risk of the former highest
bidder).

Should the Plaintiff, or one
of its representatives, fail
to be present at the time of
sale, the property is automat-
ically withdrawn from said
sale and sold at the next
available sales day upon the
terms and conditions as set
forth in the Judgment of Fore-
closure and Sale or any
Supplemental Order.

No personal or deficiency
judgment being demanded, the
bidding will not remain open
after the date of sale, but
compliance with the bid may be
made immediately.
NOTICE: The foreclosure deed

is not a warranty deed. Inter-
ested bidders should satisfy
themselves as to the quality
of title to be conveyed by
obtaining an independent title
search well before the fore-
closure sale date.
NOTICE: ANYONE THAT ATTENDS

WILL BE EXPECTED TO SOCIALLY
DISTANCE. 
The successful bidder will be

required to pay interest on
the amount of the bid from the
date of sale to date of com-
pliance with the bid at the
rate of 10.18% per annum.
B. LINDSAY CRAWFORD, III
South Carolina Bar No. 6510
THEODORE von KELLER
South Carolina Bar No. 5718
B. LINDSAY CRAWFORD, IV
South Carolina Bar No. 101707
CHRISTOPHER B. LUSK
South Carolina Bar No. 103221
CRAWFORD & von KELLER, LLC
Post Office Box 4216
Columbia, South Carolina 29240
Email: court@crawfordvk.com
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
9-17, 24, 10-1

MASTER’S SALE
2020-CP-42-00902

BY VIRTUE of a decree hereto-
fore granted in the case of:
Citibank, N.A., not in its
individual capacity, but sole-
ly as owner trustee of the New
Residential Mortgage Loan
Trust 2018-3 vs. Alicia
Hensley n/k/a Alicia Painter,
individually, as Heir or
Devisee of the Estate of Mark
Hensley a/k/a Mark Allen
Hensley, Deceased; Jennifer
Hensley, individually, as Heir
or Devisee of the Estate of
Mark Hensley a/k/a Mark Allen
Hensley, Deceased; Any Heirs-
at-Law or Devisees of the
Estate of Mark Hensley a/k/a
Mark Allen Hensley, Deceased,
their heirs or devisees, suc-
cessors and assigns, and all
other persons entitled to
claim through them; all un-
known persons with any right,
title or interest in the real
estate described herein; also
any persons who may be in the
military service of the United
States of America, being a
class designated as John Doe;
and any unknown minors or per-
sons under a disability being
a class designated as Richard
Roe; et.al., I, the under-
signed Gordon G. Cooper,
Master in Equity for Spartan-
burg County, will sell on
Tuesday, September 8, 2020 at
11:00 AM, at the County
Judicial Center, 180 Magnolia
Street, Spartanburg, SC 29304.
The property to be sold to the
highest bidder: 
All that certain piece, par-

cel or lot of land, with
improvements thereon, situate,
lying and being in the State of
South Carolina, County of
Spartanburg, and being more
particularly shown and desig-
nated as Lot No. 27, Red Fox
Farms II, Phase I, on plat
recorded June 16, 1989 in Plat
Book 107 at Page 308, in the
Office of the Register of
Deeds for Spartanburg County,
South Carolina. Reference to
said plat is made for a more
detailed description. 
This being the same property

conveyed to Mark Hensley and
Susan Hensley, for and during
their joint lives and upon the
death of either of them, then
to the survivor of them, by
Deed of Joe C. Davis and
Shannon K. Davis dated March
5, 2004 and recorded March 9,
2004 in Book 79-W at Page 360
in the ROD Office for Spar-
tanburg County. Subsequently,
Susan Hensley a/k/a. Susan
Clark Hensley a/k/a Susan
Brigail Hensley died July 13,
2015, by operation of law
vesting her interest in the
subject property to Mark
Hensley. Subsequently, Mark
Hensley a/k/a Mark Allen
Hensley died intestate on or
about March 30, 2019, leaving
the subject property to his
heirs, namely Alicia Hensley,
n/k/a Alicia Painter and
Jennifer Hensley. 
TMS No. 2-31-00-166.00 
Property address: 146 Gray

Fox Run, Chesnee, SC 29323 
TERMS OF SALE: The successful

bidder, other than the Plain-
tiff, will deposit with the
Master in Equity, at conclu-
sion of the bidding, five per-
cent (5%) of said bid is due
and payable immediately upon
closing of the bidding, in
certified funds or equivalent,
as evidence of good faith,
same to be applied to purchase

price in case of compliance,
but to be forfeited and
applied first to costs and
then to Plaintiffs debt in the
case of non-compliance. In the
event of a third party bidder
and that any third party bid-
der fails to deliver the
required deposit in certified
(immediately collectible)
funds with the Office of the
Master in Equity, said deposit
being due and payable immedi-
ately upon closing of the bid-
ding on the day of sale, the
Master in Equity will re-sell
the subject property at the
most convenient time there-
after (including the day of
sale) upon notification to
counsel for Plaintiff. Should
the last and highest bidder
fail or refuse to comply with
the balance due of the bid
within 30 days, then the
Master in Equity may re-sell
the property on the same terms
and conditions on some subse-
quent Sales Day (at the risk of
the said highest bidder). 

No personal or deficiency
judgment being demanded, the
bidding will not remain open
after the date of sale, but
compliance with the bid may be
made immediately. 
Purchaser to pay for documen-

tary stamps on Master in
Equity’s Deed. The successful
bidder will be required to pay
interest on the balance of the
bid from the date of sale to
date of compliance with the
bid at the rate of 3.000% per
annum. 
The Plaintiff may waive any of
its rights, including its
right to a deficiency judg-
ment, prior to sale. 
The sale shall be subject to

taxes and assessments, exist-
ing easements and restrictions
of record. 
This sale is subject to all

title matters of record and
any interested party should
consider performing an inde-
pendent title examination of
the subject property as no
warranty is given. 
The sale will not be held

unless either Plaintiffs
attorney or Plaintiffs bidding
agent is present at the sale
and either Plaintiffs attorney
or Plaintiffs bidding agent
enters the authorized bid of
Plaintiff for this captioned
matter. In the alternative,
Plaintiff’s counsel, if per-
mitted by the Court, may
advise this Court directly of
its authorized bidding
instructions. In the event a
sale is inadvertently held
without Plaintiffs Counselor
Counsel’s bidding agent enter-
ing the authorized bid of
Plaintiff for this specifical-
ly captioned matter, the sale
shall be null and void and the
property shall be re-adver-
tised for sale on the next
available sale date. 
Neither the Plaintiff nor its

counsel make representations
as to the integrity of the
title or the fair market value
of the property offered for
sale. Prior to bidding you may
wish to review the current
state law or seek the advice of
any attorney licensed in South
Carolina.
SCOTT AND CORLEY, P.A.
Attorney for Plaintiff
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
8-20, 27, 9-3

MASTER’S SALE
2019-CP-42-01659

BY VIRTUE of a decree hereto-
fore granted in the case of
Wilmington Savings Fund
Society, FSB, not in its indi-
vidual capacity, but solely as
indenture trustee of Citigroup
Mortgage Loan Trust 2017-RP1
against Matthew T. Curry, I,
the undersigned Master in
Equity for Spartanburg County,
will sell on September 8,
2020, at 11:00 a.m. at the
County Courthouse in Spartan-
burg, South Carolina, to the
highest bidder, the following
described property, to-wit:
All that certain piece, par-

cel or lot of land situate,
lying and being in the State of
South Carolina, County of
Spartanburg, being shown and
designated as Lot No. 65 of
Pleasant Green Section 2, as
shown on the plat thereof
recorded in Plat Book 151 at
page 100 and having, according
to said plat, metes and bounds
as shown thereon.
This is the same property con-
veyed to Matthew T Curry by
Deed of David K Andrews, dated
March 29, 2005, recorded March
30, 2005 in Deed Book 82-R at
page 554 in the Office of the
Register of Deeds for Spar-
tanburg County.
TMS No. 6-02-00-227.00
Property Address: 209 Luke

Court, Inman, SC 29349
TERMS OF SALE The successful

bidder, other than the plain-
tiff, will deposit with the
Master in Equity at conclusion
of the bidding, five per cent
(5%) of said bid, in cash or
equivalent, as evidence of
good faith, same to be applied
to purchase price in case of
compliance, but to be forfeit-

ed and applied first to costs
and then to plaintiffs debt in
the case of noncompliance.
Should the successful bidder
fail or refuse to make the
required deposit at time of
bid or comply with the other
terms of the bid within twenty
(20) days, then the Master in
Equity may resell the property
on the same terms and condi-
tions (at the risk of the said
defaulting bidder). Should the
Plaintiff, or one of its rep-
resentatives, fail to be pres-
ent at the time of sale, the
property is automatically
withdrawn from said sale and
sold at the next available
sales day upon the terms and
conditions as set forth in the
Judgment of Foreclosure and
Sale or any Supplemental
Order. The successful bidder
will be required to pay for
documentary stamps on the Deed
and interest on the balance of
the bid from the date of sale
to the date of compliance with
the bid at the rate of 4.9580%.

THIS SALE IS SUBJECT TO
ASSESSMENTS, COUNTY TAXES,
EXISTING EASEMENTS, EASEMENTS
AND RESTRICTIONS OF RECORD,
AND OTHER SENIOR ENCUMBRANCES.

No personal or deficiency
judgment being demanded, the
bidding will not remain open
after the date of sale, but
compliance with the bid may be
made immediately.
NOTICE: The foreclosure deed

is not a warranty deed. Inter-
ested bidders should satisfy
themselves as to the quality
of title to be conveyed by
obtaining an independent title
search well before the fore-
closure sale date. ATTENDEES
MUST ABIDE BY SOCIAL DISTANC-
ING GUIDELINES AND MAY BE
REQUIRED TO WEAR A MASK OR
OTHER FACIAL COVERING. Any
person who violates said pro-
tocols is subject to dismissal
at the discretion of the sell-
ing officer or other court
officials.
RILEY POPE & LANEY, LLC
Post Office Box 11412
Columbia, South Carolina 29211
Phone: (803) 799-9993
Attorneys for Plaintiffs
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
9-17, 24, 10-1

MASTER’S SALE
C/A No.: 2019-CP-42-03721 

BY VIRTUE OF A DECREE of the
Court of Common Pleas for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, heretofore issued in
the case of New York Mortgage
Funding, LLC vs. Barbara G.
Styron and if Barbara G.
Styron be deceased then any
children and heirs at law to
the Estate of Barbara G.
Styron, distributees and
devisees at law to the Estate
of Barbara G. Styron, and if
any of the same be dead any and
all persons entitled to claim
under or through them also all
other persons unknown claiming
any right, title, interest or
lien upon the real estate
described in the complaint
herein; Any unknown adults,
any unknown infants or persons
under a disability being a
class designated as John Doe,
and any persons in the mili-
tary service of the United
States of America being a
class designated as Richard
Roe; South Carolina Department
of Revenue, I the undersigned
as Master in Equity for Spar-
tanburg County, will sell on
September 8, 2020 at 11:00 AM,
at the County Court House,
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, to the highest bid-
der:

Legal Description and
Property Address:
ALL THAT PIECE, PARCEL OR LOT

OF LAND LYING, BEING AND SIT-
UATE IN THE STATE AND COUNTY
AFORESAID, SHOWN TO CONTAINING
2.00 ACRES ON PLAT OF SURVEY
FOR JOHN T. GODFREY, DATED
JUNE 18, 1987, BY JOE E.
MITCHELL, RLS, AND ON WHICH
PLAT SAID LOT IS MORE PARTIC-
ULARLY DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS:
BEGINNING AT A POINT IN ROAD
AND RUNNING THENCE, N. 79-05-
50 E. 141.23 FEET TO OLD NAIL;
THENCE, N. 78-15-50 E. 68.77
FEET TO A POINT; THENCE,
5.1700 E. 417.5 FEET TO AN IRON
PIN; THENCE, 5.78-49-30 W.
210.0 FEET TO AN OLD IRON PIN;
THENCE, N 17-00 W. 417.5 FEET
TO THE BEGINNING POINT. FOR A
MORE PARTICULAR DESCRIPTION
REFERENCE IS MADE TO THE
AFORESAID FLAT WHICH IS TO BE
RECORDED HEREWITH.

For informational purposes
said plat was recorded
September 24, 1987 in Plat
Book 102 at Page 257 in the
Office of the Register of
Deeds for Spartanburg County,
South Carolina.
THIS BEING the same property

conveyed unto Barbara G.
Styron by virtue of a Deed from
John T. Godfrey dated
September 8, 1987 and recorded
September 24, 1987 in Book 53-
P at Page 762 in the Office of
the Register of Deeds for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina.

950 Two Mile Creek Road,
Enoree, SC 29335

TMS# 4-49-00-027.02
TERMS OF SALE: For cash.

Interest at the current rate
of Five and 79960/10000
(5.79960%) to be paid on bal-
ance of bid from date of sale
to date of compliance. The
purchaser to pay for papers
and stamps, and that the suc-
cessful bidder or bidders,
other than the Plaintiff
therein, will, upon the
acceptance of his or her bid,
deposit with the Master in
Equity for Spartanburg County
a certified check or cash in
the amount equal to five per-
cent (5%) of the amount of bid
on said premises at the sale as
evidence of good faith in bid-
ding, and subject to any
resale of said premises under
Order of this Court; and in the
event the said purchaser or
purchasers fail to comply with
the terms of sale within
Twenty (20) days, the Master
in Equity shall forthwith
resell the said property,
after the due notice and
advertisement, and shall con-
tinue to sell the same each
subsequent sales day until a
purchaser, who shall comply
with the terms of sale, shall
be obtained, such sales to be
made at the risk of the former
purchaser. Since a personal or
deficiency judgment is waived,
the bidding will not remain
open but compliance with the
bid may be made immediately.
If the Plaintiff or the Plain-
tiffs representative does not
appear at the above-described
sale, then the sale of the
property will be null, void,
and of no force and effect. In
such event, the sale will be
rescheduled for the next
available sales day. Plaintiff
may waive any of its rights,
including its right to a defi-
ciency judgment, prior to
sale. Sold subject to taxes
and assessments, existing
easements and restrictions of
record.
HUTCHENS LAW FIRM, LLP
Post Office Box 8237
Columbia, South Carolina 29202
Phone: 803-726-2700
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
9-17, 24, 10-1

MASTER’S SALE
C/A No: 2017-CP-42-03508

BY VIRTUE OF A DECREE of the
Court of Common Pleas for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, heretofore issued in
the case of Wells Fargo Bank,
N.A., as Trustee for Green
Tree 2008-MH1 vs. Donna K.
Malone aka Donna Kay Malone;
2nd Palmetto Resources, Inc.;
South Carolina Department of
Motor Vehicles, I the under-
signed as Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, will sell
on September 8, 2020 at 11:00
AM, at the County Court House,
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, to the highest bid-
der:

Legal Description and
Property Address: 
ALL THAT PIECE, PARCEL OR LOT

OF LAND SITUATE, LYING AND
BEING IN THE STATE OF SOUTH
CAROLINA, COUNTY OF SPARTAN-
BURG, NEAR HOLLY SPRINGS BAP-
TIST CHURCH, AND RUNS ALONG
HAMMETT STORE ROAD, BEN HURT
ROAD, AND GOODJOIN ROAD (SC
HWY 357) AS SHOWN ON SURVEY FOR
CHARLES MALONE, JR. MADE BY
WOLFE & HUSKEY, INC. ENGINEER-
ING AND SURVEYING DATED JUNE
1, 1993, CONTAINING 2.92
ACRES, MORE OR LESS, RECORDED
IN THE RMC OFFICE FOR SPARTAN-
BURG COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA IN
PLAT BOOK 120 AT PAGE 927. REF-
ERENCE IS HEREBY MADE TO SAID
PLAT FOR A MORE COMPLETE METES
AND BOUNDS DESCRIPTION. 
TOGETHER with a 1993 24 X 50

Oakwood Mobile Home, Serial #
226314 A/B located thereon. 
THIS BEING THE SAME PROPERTY

CONVEYED UNTO CHARLES MALONE,
JR. AND DONNA K. MALONE BY
VIRTUE OF A DEED FROM CHARLES
T. MALONE, SR. DATED JUNE 10,
1993 AND RECORDED JUNE 10,
1993 IN BOOK 60-C AT PAGE 862
IN THE OFFICE OF THE REGISTER
OF DEEDS OFFICE FOR SPARTAN-
BURG COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA. 
1909 Highway 357, Lyman, SC

29365
TMS# 5-06-00-057-01 

TERMS OF SALE: For cash.
Interest at the current rate
of Four and 875/1000 (4.875%)
to be paid on balance of bid
from date of sale to date of
compliance. The purchaser to
pay for papers and stamps, and
that the successful bidder or
bidders, other than the
Plaintiff therein, will, upon
the acceptance of his or her
bid, deposit with the Master
in Equity for Spartanburg
County a certified check or
cash in the amount equal to
five percent (5%) of the
amount of bid on said premises
at the sale as evidence of good
faith in bidding, and subject
to any resale of said premises
under Order of this Court; and
in the event the said purchas-
er or purchasers fail to com-
ply with the terms of sale
within Twenty (20) days, the
Master in Equity shall forth-
with resell the said property,

after the due notice and
advertisement, and shall con-
tinue to sell the same each
subsequent sales day until a
purchaser, who shall comply
with the terms of sale, shall
be obtained, such sales to be
made at the risk of the former
purchaser. Since a personal or
deficiency judgment is waived,
the bidding will not remain
open but compliance with the
bid may be made immediately.
If the Plaintiff or the Plain-
tiff’s representative does not
appear at the above-described
sale, then the sale of the
property will be null, void,
and of no force and effect. In
such event, the sale will be
rescheduled for the next
available sales day. Plaintiff
may waive any of its rights,
including its right to a defi-
ciency judgment, prior to
sale. Sold subject to taxes
and assessments, existing
easements and restrictions of
record. 
HUTCHENS LAW FIRM 
P.O. Box 8237 
Columbia, SC 29202
803-726-2700
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
9-17, 24, 10-1

MASTER’S SALE
C/A No: 2017-CP-42-00687 

BY VIRTUE OF A DECREE of the
Court of Common Pleas for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, heretofore issued in
the case of Deutsche Bank
National Trust Company, as
Trustee for New Century Home
Equity Loan Trust, Series
2005-D, Asset Backed Pass-
Through Certificates vs.
Thomas Moorman; Candlewood
Homeowners Association, Inc.;
Founders Federal Credit Union;
Tower Homes, Inc. I the under-
signed as Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, will sell
on September 8, 2020 at 11:00
AM, at the County Court House,
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, to the highest bid-
der: 

Legal Description and
Property Address: 
ALL THAT CERTAIN piece, par-

cel or lot of land situate,
lying and being in the State of
South Carolina, County of
Spartanburg being shown and
designated as Lot 292 of
Candlewood as shown on plat
thereof recorded in Plat Book
153 at Page 7 and having,
according to said plat, metes
and bounds as shown thereon. 
THIS BEING the same property

conveyed to Thomas Moorman by
virtue of a Deed from Tower
Homes, Inc. dated November
17,2005 and recorded December
1, 2005 in Book 84-N at Page
97 in the Office of the
Register of Deeds for Spartan-
burg County, South Carolina. 
245 Waxberry Court, Boiling

Springs, SC 29316 
TMS# 2-44-00-0533.00 

TERMS OF SALE: For cash.
Interest at the current rate
of Four and 00/100 (4.00%) to
be paid on balance of bid from
date of sale to date of com-
pliance. The purchaser to pay
for papers and stamps, and
that the successful bidder or
bidders, other than the
Plaintiff therein, will, upon
the acceptance of his or her
bid, deposit with the Master
in Equity for Spartanburg
County a certified check or
cash in the amount equal to
five percent (5%) of the
amount of bid on said premises
at the sale as evidence of good
faith in bidding, and subject
to any resale of said premises
under Order of this Court; and
in the event the said purchas-
er or purchasers fail to com-
ply with the terms of sale
within Twenty (20) days, the
Master in Equity shall forth-
with resell the said property,
after the due notice and
advertisement, and shall con-
tinue to sell the same each
subsequent sales day until a
purchaser, who shall comply
with the terms of sale, shall
be obtained, such sales to be
made at the risk of the former
purchaser. Since a personal or
deficiency judgment is waived,
the bidding will not remain
open but compliance with the
bid may be made immediately.
If the Plaintiff or the Plain-
tiff’s representative does not
appear at the above-described
sale, then the sale of the
property will be null, void,
and of no force and effect. In
such event, the sale will be
rescheduled for the next
available sales day. Plaintiff
may waive any of its rights,
including its right to a defi-
ciency judgment, prior to
sale. Sold subject to taxes
and assessments, existing
easements and restrictions of
record.
Hutchens Law Firm 
Post Office Box 8237 
Columbia, South Carolina 29202 
803-726-2700
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
9-17, 24, 10-1



Legal Notices
MASTER’S SALE

C/A No.: 2020-CP-42-00898
BY VIRTUE OF A DECREE of the

Court of Common Pleas for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, heretofore issued in
the case of U.S. Bank National
Association, as Trustee for
Residential Asset Mortgage
Products, Inc., Mortgage
Asset-Backed Pass-Through
Certificates, Series 2006-NC2
vs. Robert Hawkins a/k/a
Robert M. Hawkins; Patricia L.
McMakin, I the undersigned as
Master in Equity for Spartan-
burg County, will sell on
September 8, 2020 at 11:00 AM,
at the County Court House,
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, to the highest bid-
der:

Legal Description and
Property Address:
All that certain piece, par-

cel or Jot of land, with the
improvements thereon, if any,
situate, lying and being in
the County of Spartanburg,
State of South Carolina, being
shown and delineated as Lot 2,
containing 1.40 acres, more or
Jess, on a plat of property of
Fairmont Mills, prepared for
John A. & Gladys C. Mitchem, by
Archie S. Deaton & Associates,
dated August 13, 1984 and
recorded in the Office of the
R.M.C. for Spartanburg County
in Plat Book 92, Page 251; ref-
erence being made to the same
for a more complete and accu-
rate description; all measure-
ments being a little more or
less.
This conveyance is made sub-

ject to any and all existing
reservations, easements,
right-of-way, zoning ordi-
nances, and restrictive or
protective covenants that may
appear of record or on the
premises.
This being the same property

conveyed to Patricia L.
McMakin by Deed of Kevin L.
Mitchem and Avonda C. Mitchem
dated August 29, 2003 and
recorded September 5, 2003 in
Deed Book 78-Q at Page 688, in
the Office of the Register of
Deeds for Spartanburg County,
South Carolina.

Thereafter, Patricia L.
McMakin conveyed the subject
property to Patricia L.
McMakin and Robert Hawkins by
Quit Claim Deed dated October
31, 2005 and recorded November
9, 2005 in Deed Book 844 at
Page 488, in the Office of the
Register of Deeds for Spartan-
burg County, South Carolina.
660 Fairmont Avenue, Spartan-

burg, SC 29301 
TMS# 5-27-13-038.00

TERMS OF SALE: For cash.
Interest at the current rate
of Two and 125/1000 (2.125%)
to be paid on balance of bid
from date of sale to date of
compliance. The purchaser to
pay for papers and stamps, and
that the successful bidder or
bidders, other than the
Plaintiff therein, will, upon
the acceptance of his or her
bid, deposit with the Master
in Equity for Spartanburg
County a certified check or
cash in the amount equal to
five percent (5%) of the
amount of bid on said premises
at the sale as evidence of good
faith in bidding, and subject
to any resale of said premises
under Order of this Court; and
in the event the said purchas-
er or purchasers fail to com-
ply with the terms of sale
within Twenty (20) days, the
Master in Equity shall forth-
with resell the said property,
after the due notice and
advertisement, and shall con-
tinue to sell the same each
subsequent sales day until a
purchaser, who shall comply
with the terms of sale, shall
be obtained, such sales to he
made at the risk of the former
purchaser. Since a personal or
deficiency judgment is waived,
the bidding will not remain
open but compliance with the
bid may be made immediately.
If the Plaintiff or the Plain-
tiffs representative does not
appear at the above-described
sale, then the sale of the
property will be null, void,
and of no force and effect. In
such event, the sale will be
rescheduled for the next
available sales day. Plaintiff
may waive any of its rights,
including its right to a defi-
ciency judgment, prior to
sale. Sold subject to taxes
and assessments, existing
easements and restrictions of
record.
HUTCHENS LAW FIRM LLP
Post Office Box 8237
Columbia, South Carolina 29202
Phone: 803-726-2700
HON. GORDON G. COOPER
Master in Equity for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
9-17, 24, 10-1

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE FAMILY COURT

SEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
2020-DR-42-0202

South Carolina Department of
Social Services, Plaintiff,
vs. Candice Jordan, et al.,
Defendants.
IN RE: Female Minor (2007)

Minors Under the Age of 18
Summons and Notice

TO DEFENDANTS: Candice Jordan
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the com-
plaint for non-emergency
removal in and to the minor
child in this action, the
original of which has been
filed in the Office of the
Clerk of Court for Amy Cox, on
January 27, 2020, a copy of
which will be delivered to you
upon request; and to serve a
copy of your answer to the com-
plaint upon the undersigned
attorney for the Plaintiff at
Patrica L. Wilson, 630 Chesnee
Hwy, Spartanburg, SC, 29303
within thirty (30) days fol-
lowing the date of service
upon you, exclusive of the day
of such service; and if you
fail to answer the complaint
within the time stated, the
Plaintiff will apply for judg-
ment by default against the
Defendants for the relief
demanded in the complaint.

YOU ARE FURTHER NOTIFIED
that: (1) the Guardian ad
litem (GAL) who is appointed
by the court in this action to
represent the best interests
of the children will provide
the family court with a writ-
ten report that includes an
evaluation and assessment of
the issues brought before the
court along with recommenda-
tions; (2) the GAL's written
report will be available for
review twenty-four (24) hours
in advance of the hearing; (3)
you may review the report at
the GAL Program county office.
July 29, 2020
Spartanburg, South Carolina
S.C. DEPT. OF SOCIAL SERVICES
Patricia L. Wilson
South Carolina Bar No. 77587
Attorney for Plaintiff
S.C. Dept. of Social Services
630 Chesnee Highway
Spartanburg, SC 29303
(864) 345-1013 /(864) 596-2337
8-6, 13, 20

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
Case No.: 2020-CP-42-01916

Vanderbilt Mortgage and
Finance, Inc., Plaintiff, -vs-
The Estate of Sylvester Dayton
Surratt a/k/a Sylvester Daton
Surratt a/k/a Sylvester D.
Surratt; The Estate of Donald
Ray Surratt and David Surratt,
Heirs at Law of Sylvester
Dayton Surratt, deceased;
Yolanda Jackson, Heir at law
of Donald Ray Surratt,
deceased; all Unknown Heirs of
Deceased Defendants, and all
other persons entitled to
claim under or through them
being a class designated as
Mary Roe;  all Unknown persons
with any right, title or
interest in the real estate
described herein, being a
class designated as Jane Doe;
also any Unknown persons who
may be in the military service
of the United States of
America, being a class desig-
nated as John Doe; and any
Unknown minors, persons under
a Disability or persons incar-
cerated, being a class desig-
nated as Richard Roe;
Spartanburg Regional Health
Services District, Inc. and
the South Carolina Department
of Motor Vehicles, Defen-
dant(s)

Summons
TO THE DEFENDANT(S), The

Estate of Sylvester Dayton
Surratt a/k/a Sylvester Daton
Surratt a/k/a Sylvester D.
Surratt; The Estate of Donald
Ray Surratt
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint in this action, and to
serve a copy of your Answer on
the subscribers at their
offices, 1640 St. Julian
Place, Columbia, South Caro-
lina 29202, within thirty (30)
days after service hereof,
exclusive of the day of such
service; except that the
United States of America, if
named, shall have sixty (60)
days to answer after the serv-
ice hereof, exclusive of the
day of such service; and if you
fail to answer the Complaint
within the time aforesaid, the
Plaintiff in this action will
apply to the Court for a judg-
ment by default granting the
relief demanded in the Com-
plaint.

TO MINOR(S) OVER FOURTEEN
YEARS OF AGE, AND/OR TO
MINOR(S) UNDER FOURTEEN YEARS
OF AGE AND THE PERSON WITH WHOM
THE MINOR(S) RESIDE(S), AND/OR
TO PERSON UNDER SOME LEGAL
DISABILITY, INCOMPETENTS AND
PERSONS CONFINED:
YOU ARE FURTHER SUMMONED AND

NOTIFIED to apply for the
appointment of a Guardian ad
Litem within thirty (30) days
after service of this Summons
and Notice upon you.  If you
fail to do so, application for
such appointment will be made
by the Plaintiff.
Notice of Filing Complaint
YOU WILL PLEASE TAKE NOTICE

that the Summons and Complaint
in the above-captioned action
were filed on June 12, 2020, in
the Office of the Clerk of
Court for Spartanburg County,

South Carolina.
Notice of Order Appointing 
Guardian Ad Litem Nisi and
Notice a Guardian Ad Litem

Appointed
PLEASE TAKE NOTICE THAT an

action involving real property
known as 106 Blue Dawn Road,
in which you may have an inter-
est, has been commenced in the
Court of Common Pleas for
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina and that, by Order of
the Clerk of Court filed
therein on ,   Kelley Woody has
been appointed as the attorney
to represent any unknown
Defendants that may be in the
military service represented
by the class designated as
John Doe and Guardian ad Litem
Nisi for all minors and per-
sons under legal disability as
a class designated as Richard
Roe, Defendants herein.

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE THAT,
unless you or someone on your
behalf apply to the Court for
appointment of a suitable per-
son to act as Attorney or
Guardian ad Litem herein,
within thirty (30) days after
service by publication of this
Notice, the appointment of
Kelley Woody  as Guardian ad
Litem shall be made absolute.

Lis Pendens
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an
action has been commenced and
is now pending in this Court
upon the Complaint of the
above-named Plaintiff for the
foreclosure of a certain mort-
gage of real estate given by
Sylvester D. Surratt and Mae
D. Surratt to Vanderbilt Mort-
gage and Finance, Inc. dated
December 8, 2010, and recorded
in the Office of the Register
of Deeds for Spartanburg
County on December 21, 2010 at
2:50 pm in Book 4422 at Page
011  The premises covered and
affected by the said mortgage
and the foreclosure thereof,
were, at the time of making
thereof and at the time of the
filing of the Lis Pendens, as
described on the attached
Exhibit "A".

Exhibit "A"
All that certain piece, par-

cel or tract of property in
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, located near Chesnee
and being more fully designat-
ed and shown on a plat of sur-
vey dated March 2, 1979, pre-
pared by Wolfe & Huskey, Inc.
Engineers and Surveyors, for
Larry J. Lipscomb and des-
cribed thereon as follows:
Beginning at an iron pin, old

marker at joint comer with
Hill Top Drive and Martha
Curtis and running thence N.
67-31 W., 114.5 feet to an old
iron pin at the join comer of
Elder and Hill Top Drive;
thence along old line N. 42-15
W., 118.7 feet to an iron pin;
thence N. 15-00 E., 121.1 feet
to an iron pin; thence with the
line of William Dawkins, S.
75-06 E., 213.3 feet to an old
iron pin; thence with Martha
Curtis line S. 14-47 W., 199.5
feet to the beginning corner
and containing, 0.85 acres,
more or less.
This being the same property

conveyed unto Sylvester D. and
Mae D. Surratt by deed of Larry
J. Lipscomb dated March 28,
1996 and recorded April 9,
1996 in the Office of the
Register of Deeds for Spartan-
burg County in Book 64-B at
Page 460.  Mae D. Surratt died
on November 4, 2013. 
Subsequently a Deed of Dis-

tribution dated September 25,
2019 and recorded in the
Office of the Register of
Deeds for Aiken County on Sep-
tember 25, 2019 conveyed one-
half interest of said property
to Sylvester Daton Surratt,
one-quarter interest to Donald
Ray Surratt and a one-quarter
interest to David Surratt. 
Columbia, South Carolina
July 31, 2020
Crawford & von Keller, LLC 
Post Office Box 4216
1640 St. Julian Place (29204)
Columbia, South Carolina 29240
Phone: 803-790-2626
Email: court@crawfordvk.com
Attorneys for Plaintiff
8-6, 13, 20

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE FAMILY COURT OF 

THE SEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
Case No.: 2020-DR-42-0337

Stacey Bogan and Glenn Bogan,
Plaintiffs, vs. Courtney Bogan
and Aaron Seagraves, Defen-
dants, IN THE INTEREST OF: 2
minor children under the age
of 18

Summons and Notice
TO THE DEFENDANTS ABOVE-

NAMED:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint in this action, a copy
of which is hereby served upon
you, and to serve a copy of
your Answer to the said Com-
plaint on the undersigned at,
South Carolina Legal Services,
148 East Main Street, Spartan-
burg, South Carolina 29306,
within thirty (30) days (thir-
ty-five (35) if service was by
certified mail) after the
service of this summons upon
you, exclusive of the day of

service. If you fail to answer
the Complaint within that
time, Plaintiff shall apply to
the Court for a judgment by
default against you for the
relief demanded in the Com-
plaint.
Spartanburg, South Carolina
July 31, 2020
SOUTH CAROLINA LEGAL SERVICES
Kevin Raus, Esquire
Attorney for Plaintiff
South Carolina Legal Services
Spartanburg, S.C. 29306
Phone: (864) 582-0369
8-6, 13, 20

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE FAMILY COURT

SEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
Docket No.: 2020-DR-42-0399

MARVALYN MCLEMORE, Plaintiff,
vs. JOHN DOE, RICHARD ROE and
KEVIN TRONARD DAVIS, Defen-
dants.

Summons
TO THE DEFENDANTS ABOVE-

NAMED:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint herein, a copy of which
is served upon you, and to
serve a copy of your answer to
this complaint upon the sub-
scriber, at the address shown
below, within thirty (30) days
after service hereof, exclu-
sive of the day of such serv-
ice; and if you fail to answer
the Complaint, an Affidavit of
Default will be filed in this
case against you, and the
Plaintiff shally apply to the
Court for the relief demanded
in the Complaint.
Dated: July 29, 2020
Spartanburg, South Carolina
Kenneth P. Shabel
South Carolina Bar # 16136
KENNEDY & BRANNON, LLC
Post Office Box 3254
Spartanburg, S.C. 29304
Phone: 864.707.2020
Fax: 864.707.2030
ken@kennedybrannon.com
8-6, 13, 20

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
SEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT

Case No.: 2019-CP-42-02600
John W. Pearson, Plaintiff,
vs. Jewel Elizabeth Gideon
Taylor, Phillip Taylor, Jr.,
Thomas Taylor, Jr. and Karen
Hudson; also, all other per-
sons unknown claiming any
right, title, estate, interest
in or lien upon the real estate
described in the Complaint,
Defendants.

Summons for Relief
TO DEFENDANTS: Phillip Taylor

Jr., Thomas Taylor, Karen
Hudson:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint in this action, a copy
of which is herewith served
upon you, and to serve a copy
of your Answer to the said Com-
plaint on the subscriber at
his office at 200A Ezell
Street, Spartanburg, S.C.
29306-2338, within thirty (30)
days after the service there-
of, exclusive of the day of
service, and if you fail to
answer the Complaint within
the time aforesaid, the Plain-
tiff in this action, will
apply to the Court for the
relief demanded in the Com-
plaint.

TO: PHILLIP TAYLOR, JR.,
THOMAS TAYLOR, AND KAREN HUD-
SON:
YOU WILL TAKE NOTICE that

unless you, or someone on your
behalf, applies to the Court
within thirty (30) days of the
date of service hereof to have
a Guardian ad Litem appointed
to represent you in this mat-
ter, then the Plaintiff will
apply to the Court for such
appointment.
YOU WILL PLEASE TAKE NOTICE

that the original Summons and
Complaint and Lis Pendens were
filed in the Office of the
Clerk of Court for Spartanburg
County on July 23, 2019.
August 4, 2020
MAX B. CAUTHEN, JR.
Attorney for Plaintiff
200 Ezell Street
Spartanburg, S.C. 29306
Phone: 864-585-8797

Lis Pendens
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an
action has been commenced and
is pending in this Court upon
the Complaint of the above-
named Plaintiff against the
above-named Defendants to
quiet title to a tax deed title
to real estate owned by Plain-
tiff and described as follows:

Watson Road, Enoree, S.C.
29335
All that certain piece, par-

cel or lot of land, lying,
located and being situate in
the County of Spartanburg,
State of South Carolina, near
Cross Anchor, being shown and
designated as 13.00 acres,
more or less, as shown on plat
for Phillip M. Taylor, dated
January 3, 1990, by James V.
Gregory, PLS, recorded in Plat
Book 109, at Page 257, in the
Office of the Register of
Deeds for Spartanburg County,
South Carolina.
LESS AND EXCEPT: (1) 8.1 acres
conveyed in Deed Book 118-X at

Page 705, with the Spartanburg
County Register of Deeds
Office; (2) 0.91 acress con-
veyed in Deed Book 115-W at
Page 731 with the Spartanburg
County Register of Deeds
Office; (3) 1.21 acres and
0.08 acres conveyed in Deed
Book 120-N at Page 577 with the
Spartanburg County Register of
Deeds Office. The resulting
tax parcel conveyed by this
Tax Deed contains approximate-
ly 2.7 acres. Block Map Number
4-51-00-012.11
July 23, 2019
s/ Max B. Cauthen Jr.
MAX B. CAUTHEN, JR.
Attorney for Plaintiff
200 Ezell Street
Spartanburg, S.C. 29306
Phone: 864-585-8797
8-6, 13, 20

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
C/A No. 2020-CP-42-01627

Palm TSF, LLC v. Howard
Investors, LLC, et al.

Summons, Lis Pendens, and
Notice of Filing of Complaint
TO: Howard Investors, LLC;

C.E. Brock; Carolina Driveline
Inc.:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint in this action, a copy
of which is hereby served on
you, and to serve a copy of
your Answer to the Complaint
on counsel for Plaintiff at
1320 Main Street, Meridian
Building 17th Floor, Columbia,
South Carolina, 29201, within
thirty days after service of
this Complaint, exclusive of
the day of service, and if you
fail to answer the Complaint
within the thirty days, judg-
ment by default will be ren-
dered against you for the
relief demanded in the Com-
plaint.
YOU WILL ALSO TAKE NOTICE that
a Complaint was filed on May
16, 2020, in the Spartanburg
County Clerk of Court’s Office
seeking to quiet title to 3050
Howard Street, Spartanburg SC
29303.
YOU WILL ALSO TAKE NOTICE that
an action has been commenced
and is now pending in this
court upon complaint of the
above-named plaintiffs against
the above-named defendant(s)
to have a tax title to real
property quieted in the name
of the plaintiff(s). The prop-
erty that is the subject mat-
ter of this action is located
at 3050 Howard Street, Spar-
tanburg SC 29303, situated in
Spartanburg County, South
Carolina, and is more properly
described as Parcel No. 6-13-
11-006.00.
Matthew A. Abee, Esq.
1320 Main Street / 17th Floor
Columbia, South Carolina 29201
Phone: (803) 799-2000
Counsel for Plaintiff
8-13, 20, 27

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE PROBATE COURT

Case Number 2020-ES-42-00226
Chad A. Cash, Petitioner, vs.
Peggy Cash Snipes, Elaine
Cash, Crystal Cash, Kim Bogan,
Gwen Angeli, Ricky Riddle,
Teresa Rojas, David Riddle,
Heath Riddle and Deana Riddle,
Respondents.
In Re: Estate of Daniel Elmore
Cash, deceased

Summons
TO the above named Respon-

dents in this action:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Peti-
tion and Supplemental Petition
in this action which were
filed in the Spartanburg
County Probate Court on
February 5, 2020 copies of
which are herewith served upon
you, and to serve a copy of
your answer to the said Peti-
tion and Supplemental Petition
on the subscribers at their
office at Spartanburg, S.C.,
within thirty (30) days after
the service hereof, exclusive
of the day of such service; and
if you fail to answer the
Petition within the time
aforesaid, the Petitioner in
this action will apply to the
Courtfor the relief demanded
in the Petition.
February 4, 2020
JAMES B. DRENNAN, III
Dennis, Shaw, Drennan & Pack LLC
103 Lafayette Street
Spartanburg, S.C. 29302
Phone: (864) 582-0708
Attorneys for Petitioner

STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG
IN THE PROBATE COURT

IN THE MATTER OF: ESTATE OF
DANIEL ELMORE CASH (Decedent)
Case No.: 2020-ES-42-00226

Notice of Hearing
Date: October 14, 2020
Time: 3:00 p.m.
Place: Spartanburg County

Probate Court
Purpose of Hearing: Hearing

on Petition for Formal Testacy
and Supplemental Petition
filed by Chad A. Cash, Peti-
tioner

Executed this 5th day of
August, 2020.
JAMES B. DRENNAN, III
Post Office Box 891

Spartanburg, S.C. 29304
Phone: (864) 582-0708
Attorney for Petitioner
8-13, 20, 27

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
C/A No.: 2020-CP-42-01974

U.S. Bank National Associa-
tion, as Trustee for
Structured Asset Securities
Corporation Mortgage Pass-
Through Certificates, Series
2005-RMS1, Plaintiff, v.
Anthony J. McCutchen a/k/a
Anthony J. McCutcheon; Sharita
McCutchen a/k/a Sharita
McCutcheon, Defendant(s).

Summons and Notices
(Non-Jury) Foreclosure of

Real Estate Mortgage
TO THE DEFENDANT(S) ABOVE

NAMED:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to appear and defend
by answering the Complaint in
this action, a copy of which is
hereby served upon you, and to
serve a copy of your Answer on
the subscribers at their
offices at 3800 Fernandina
Road, Suite 110, Columbia, SC
29210, within thirty (30) days
after the service hereof,
exclusive of the day of such
service; except that the
United States of America, if
named, shall have sixty (60)
days to answer after the serv-
ice hereof, exclusive of the
day of such service; and if you
fail to do so, judgment by
default will be rendered
against you for the relief
demanded in the Complaint.

TO MINOR(S) OVER FOURTEEN
YEARS OF AGE, AND/OR TO
MINOR(S) UNDER FOURTEEN YEARS
OF AGE AND THE PERSON WITH WHOM
THE MINOR(S) RESIDES, AND/OR
TO PERSONS UNDER SOME LEGAL
DISABILITY:
YOU ARE FURTHER SUMMONED AND

NOTIFIED to apply for the
appointment of a guardian ad
litem within thirty (30) days
after the service of this
Summons and Notice upon you.
If you fail to do so, applica-
tion for such appointment will
be made by Attorney for Plain-
tiff.
YOU WILL ALSO TAKE NOTICE that
Plaintiff will move for an
Order of Reference or the
Court may issue a general
Order of Reference of this
action to a Master-in-Equity/
Special Referee, pursuant to
Rule 53 of the South Carolina
Rules of Civil Procedure.
YOU WILL ALSO TAKE NOTICE that
under the provisions of S.C.
Code Ann. § 29-3-100, effec-
tive June 16, 1993, any col-
lateral assignment of rents
contained in the referenced
Mortgage is perfected and
Attorney for Plaintiff hereby
gives notice that all rents
shall be payable directly to
it by delivery to its under-
signed attorneys from the date
of default. In the alterna-
tive, Plaintiff will move
before a judge of this Circuit
on the 10th day after service
hereof, or as soon thereafter
as counsel may be heard, for an
Order enforcing the assignment
of rents, if any, and com-
pelling payment of all rents
covered by such assignment
directly to the Plaintiff,
which motion is to be based
upon the original Note and
Mortgage herein and the Com-
plaint attached hereto.
Notice of Filing Complaint
TO THE DEFENDANTS ABOVE

NAMED:
YOU WILL PLEASE TAKE NOTICE

that the original Complaint,
Cover Sheet for Civil Actions
and Certificate of Exemption
from ADR in the above entitled
action was filed in the Office
of the Clerk of Court for Spar-
tanburg County on June 19,
2020. A Notice of Foreclosure
Intervention was also filed in
the Clerk of Court's Office.
Brock & Scott, PLLC
3800 Fernandina Rd., Suite 110
Columbia, South Carolina 29210
Phone 844-856-6646 
Fax 803-454-3451 
Attorneys for Plaintiff
8-13, 20, 27 

LEGAL NOTICE
2007 Dodge Ram Vin#
3D7KS29C7G723089 is being held
by Mcclean Diesel LLC. If
charges and allowable cost are
not paid within 30 days, all
rights, title, and interest in
this vehicle will be waived
and consent be assumed for the
sale of this vehicle at public
auction. To discuss contact
8643454568.     8-20, 27, 9-3

LEGAL NOTICE
1999 Ford F350 Vin#
1FTWW33F2XEE92893 is being
held by Mcclean Diesel LLC. If
charges and allowable cost are
not paid within 30 days, all
rights, title, and interest in
this vehicle will be waived
and consent be assumed for the
sale of this vehicle at public
auction. To discuss contact
8643454568.     8-20, 27, 9-3
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 Legal Notices
LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF SPARTANBURG

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS
SEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT

Case No.: 2020-CP-42-00697
William J. Cooley, Jr., Plain-
tiff, vs. Karla Yamileth
Zelaya; Elvin M. Urbina
Ortega; Brenda Juarez; Nalley
Juarez; and B.Z.L., a minor,
Defendants.
Amended Summons for Relief

(Non-Jury)
TO THE ABOVE-NAMED DEFENDANTS

IN THIS ACTION:
YOU ARE HEREBY SUMMONED and

required to answer the Com-
plaint in this action, a copy
of which is herewith served
upon you, and to serve a copy
of your answer to the said Com-
plaint on the subscriber at
his office at 296 S. Daniel
Morgan Avenue, Spartanburg,
South Carolina, within (30)
days after the service hereof,
exclusive of the day of such
service; and if you fail to
answer the Complaint within
the time aforesaid, the Plain-
tiffs in this action will
apply to the Court for a
default judgment for the
relief demanded in the Com-
plaint.
YOU ARE FURTHER SUMMONED AND

NOTIFIED TO APPLY FOR THE
APPOINTMENT OF A GUARDIAN AD
LITEM WITHIN THIRTY (30) DAYS
AFTER SERVICE OF THIS SUMMONS
AND NOTICE UPON YOU. IF YOU
FAIL TO DO SO, APPLICATION FOR
SUCH APPOINTMENT WILL BE MADE
BY THE PLAINTIFF IMMEDIATELY
AND SEPARATELY AND SUCH APPLI-
CATION WILL BE DEEMED ABSOLUTE
AND TOTAL IN THE ABSENCE OF
YOUR APPLICATION FOR SUCH
APPOINTMENT WITHIN THIRTY (30)
DAYS AFTER THE SERVICE OF THE
SUMMONS ANDN COMPLAINT.
April 29, 2020
Spartanburg, South Carolina
s/ Gary L. Compton
GARY L. COMPTON
South Carolina Bar No. 1351
Attorney for Plaintiff
296 S. Daniel Morgan Avenue
Spartanburg, S.C. 29306
Phone: (864) 583-5186
Fax: (864) 585-0139
gary@garylcompton.com
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Helen M. Bagwell
Date of Death: May 27, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200832
Personal Representative:
Connie B. Nelson
65 Lake Forest Drive
Greenville, SC 29609
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Mary P. Blankinship
AKA Mary Padgett
Date of Death: May 29, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200803
Personal Representatives:
Roy P. Padgett, Jr.
1105 Duncan Reidville Road
Duncan, SC 29334       AND
James T. Padgett
100 Gwendolyn Avenue
Lyman, SC 29365
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within

eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Ray Earl Rabb
Date of Death: May 30, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201052
Personal Representative:
Bobby Rabb Sr.
8 Picadilly Street
Taylors, SC 29687
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Larry Dean Alexander Jr.
AKA Larry Dean Alexander
AKA Larry D. Alexander II
Date of Death: February 12, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200351
Personal Representative:
Ms. Cynthia J. Alexander
22 Green Acres Drive
Boiling Springs, SC 29316
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Doris Ann Law
Date of Death: January 19, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200816
Personal Representative:
Ms. Dora Adams
1900 Old Parker Road
Greenville, SC 29609
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Jasper Bernard Brian
Date of Death: February 2, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200892
Personal Representative:
Mr. Christian Brian
329 Thacker Court
Inman, SC 29349
Atty: Thomas A. Killoren Jr.
Post Office Box 3547
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,

Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Cindy Giraldo    AKA 
Cindy Carolina Giraldo-Rendon
Date of Death: June 21, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201059
Personal Representative:
Ms. Maria M. Rendon Valencia
205 Wayfair Lane
Wellford, SC 29385
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Thomas Edward Gibbs Sr.
AKA Thomas Edward Gibbs
Date of Death: June 24, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200957
Personal Representative:
Judy Brown Gibbs
129 Belvedere Drive
Spartanburg, SC 29301
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Oscar Williams
AKA Howard Oscar Williams
AKA H. Oscar Williams
Date of Death: May 26, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200979
Personal Representative:
Ms. Ann S. Williams
131 Bobo Drive
Inman, SC 29349
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Jassie Bell Jr.
AKA    Jassie Bell
Date of Death: March 18, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200829
Personal Representative:
Ms. Deborah Bell
280 Bridges Street
Inman, SC 29349
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180

Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Perry Keith Howell
Date of Death: March 22, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201054
Personal Representative:
Ms. Kimberly Bain Howell
3997 Country Club Road
Spartanburg, SC 29302
Atty: Kenneth C. Anthony Jr.
Post Office Box 3565
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Eleanor B. Foster
Date of Death: July 8, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201048
Personal Representative:
Ms. Jayne Foster Belmont
155 Lakewood Drive
Spartanburg, SC 29302
Atty: James B. Drennan, III
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Ben Harris Young Jr.
AKA    Ben H. Young
Date of Death: November 28, 2019
Case Number: 2020ES4201027
Personal Representative:
Ms. Mattie Young
101 Young Road
Chesnee, SC 29323
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Bobby Joe Gore Sr.
AKA    Bobby J. Gore
Date of Death: May 26, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200856
Personal Representative:
Ms. Frances E. Gore
1848 Sandy Ford Road
Chesnee, SC 29323
8-6, 13, 20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates

MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Lothar Giesbertz
Date of Death: May 9, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200817
Personal Representative:
Paulette Giesbertz
112 Eastwood Circle
Spartanburg, SC 29302
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Jerry D. Lipsey
AKA Jerry Dean Lipsey, Sr.
Date of Death: May 25, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200914
Personal Representative:
Sandra Jean Frey
1110 Blackstock Road
Pauline, SC 29374
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Franklin R. Benson Sr.
AKA Franklin R. Benson
AKA Franklin D.R. Franklin Sr.
Date of Death: January 9, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200544
Personal Representative:
Fannie D. Benson
Post Office Box 174
Woodruff, SC 29388
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Hettie E. Darby-Voegeli
Date of Death: June 14, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200883
Personal Representative:
Mr. Julius M. Rutland
151 Ravines Lane
Spartanburg, SC 29301
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM

#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Archer William Cook Jr.
AKA Archer W. Cook
Date of Death: July 12, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201094
Personal Representative:
Ms. Elizabeth C. Wolfe
169 Henson Street
Spartanburg, SC 29307
Atty: Heather G. Hunter
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Elisey Mikhailovich 
Tarasenko
Date of Death: February 11, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200898
Personal Representative:
Ms. Tatyana Tarasenko
139 Shaw Ridge Drive
Woodruff, SC 29388
Atty: Ryan F. McCarty
Post Office Box 3547
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Robert Connor Hawkins
Date of Death: June 14, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201067
Personal Representative:
Robert T. Hawkins
114 Coldspring Drive
Spartanburg, SC 29301
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Florence Carter Lerch
Twitty
Date of Death: April 28, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201044
Personal Representative:
Joseph K. Maddox, Jr.
Post Office Box 1702
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-13, 20, 27

6                       THE SPARTAN WEEKLY NEWS        AUGUST 20, 2020



Legal Notices
NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES

All persons having claims
against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Catherine Hutcherson
Date of Death: April 25, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201033
Personal Representative:
Eddie Malcolm Hutcherson
165 Hidden Lake Drive
Chesnee, SC 29323
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Wilburn Lee Dye
Date of Death: July 11, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201038
Personal Representative:
Mr. Darwin J. Wilson
1460 Mimosa Lake Road
Spartanburg, SC 29302
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and

address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: David Lee Bittinger
Date of Death: June 1, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201110
Personal Representative:
Kim Driskill
162 Cherokee Circle
Spartanburg, SC 29307
Atty: Kristin Burnett Barber
Post Office Drawer 5587
Spartanburg, SC 29304-5587
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Sammy Huey Turner
Date of Death: April 10, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200639
Personal Representative:
Ms. Annie Ruth Williams Turner
215 Springwater Drive
Spartanburg, SC 29303
8-13, 20, 27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Alpha Kay Jordan
Date of Death: March 29, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200649
Personal Representative:
Ms. Jane Myers Collins
4900 Coy Way
Knoxville, TN 37912
Atty: James B. Drennan III
Post Office Box 891
Spartanburg, SC 29302
8-13, 20, 27

LEGAL NOTICE
2020ES4201023

The Will of William Glenn
Moon, Deceased, was delivered
to me and filed July 17, 2020.
No proceedings for the probate
of said Will have begun.
HON. PONDA A. CALDWELL
Judge, Probate Court for
Spartanburg County, S.C.
8-13, 20, 27 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Lee J. Jeffords
Date of Death: March 22, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201123
Personal Representative:
Ms. Ann B. Jeffords
2466 Country Club Road
Spartanburg, SC 29302
Atty: Kenneth C. Anthony Jr.
Post Office Box 3565
Spartanburg, SC 29304
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Aubrey Steven McAbee
Date of Death: July 5, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201017
Personal Representative:
Ms. Lynne C. McAbee
422 Oakview Farms Road
Woodruff, SC 29388
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court

of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Glenn Alan Meddaugh
Date of Death: May 28, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201134
Personal Representative:
Daniel Neil Meddaugh
319 Nodine Park Drive
Inman, SC 29349
Atty: Daniel R. Dalton
1017 Chuck Dawley Blvd., Suite
200
Mt. Pleasant, SC 29464
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Joyce Carroll
Date of Death: July 23, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201102
Personal Representative:
Mr. Robert D. Carroll
150 Farms Bridge Road
Inman, SC 29349
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the

basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Annie Jean Sullivan
Gaffney
Date of Death: June 29, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201135
Personal Representative:
JoAnn Shunette Gaffney
305 East Bearden Street
Greer, SC 29651
Atty: Patrick O. Dollar
212 Trade Street
Greer, SC 29651
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Frances P. Gibson
AKA Frances Irene Gibson
Date of Death: July 9, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201035
Personal Representative:
Steven E. Gibson
102 Carlisle Bennett Road
Spartanburg, SC 29307
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Billy Dean Davis
Date of Death: April 22, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200713
Personal Representative:
Christopher Davis
3800 Jug Factory Road
Greer, SC 29651
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Patrick McMillan
Date of Death: May 1, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4200874
Personal Representative:
Beverly K. Taylor
219 Liberty Road
Candler, NC 28715
8-20, 27, 9-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS OF ESTATES
All persons having claims

against the following estates
MUST file their claims on FORM
#371ES with the Probate Court
of Spartanburg County, the
address of which is 180
Magnolia Street Room 302,
Spartanburg, SC 29306, within
eight (8) months after the date
of the first publication of
this Notice to Creditors or
within one (1) year from date
of death, whichever is earlier
(SCPC 62-3-801, et seq.) or
such persons shall be forever
barred as to their claims. All
claims are required to be pre-
sented in written statement on
the prescribed form (FORM
#371ES) indicating the name and
address of the claimant, the
basis of the claim, the amount
claimed, the date when the
claim will become due, the
nature of any uncertainty as to
the claim, and a description of
any security as to the claim.
Estate: Ronnie C. DeYoung
Date of Death: June 26, 2020
Case Number: 2020ES4201084
Personal Representative:
Gloria DeYoung
917 Harvey Road
Greer, SC 29651
8-20, 27, 9-3
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Security Finance

Corporation of Spartanburg

seeks 

Senior Software Developer 

3 (multiple openings) 

in Spartanburg, SC to

develop, code, & conduct

testing on software

programs & applications.  

Send resume to 

Aaron Hiner, 

Security Finance

Corporation of Spartanburg, 

181Security Place,

Spartanburg, SC 29307.
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